BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE: October 28, 2015

JOB TITLE: Furnishing and delivery of Janitorial Supplies to Various CoM Departments
IFB 15-16/P43

Cleaner; concentrated heavy-duty for toilet howls and
urinals, Chemifax HVY DTY concentrate cleaner (12
1 gt./cs)

Cleaner; Toilet Bowl, Pratt Toilet Ring Remover,
2 Industrial Strength (4 gallon/case)

3 Cleanser; powder, foaming (24/210z./cs)

Deodorant block; w/o wire, 40z. Urinal block (12/bx,
4 12box/case)

5 Deodorant urinal block; screen (pk/12)

6 Detergent; laundry, Tide industrial, {36lb. Box)
7 Detergen; Dish, Dawn liquid, {8/38cz./cs)

8 Detergent; liquid, floor, (4/gal/cs)

9 Disinfectant; liquid Pine Oil cleaner, (4gal/cs)

10 Disinfectant; liquid, lemon scent (4gal/cs)
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11 Disinfectant; liquid mint disinfectant cleaner (4galics) GALLON $ 1190 $ 12.32

Disinfectant; spray cleaner, Country Fresh disinfectant

12 (12/150z./cs) CASE $ 7495 no bid
Disinfectant; spray cleaner, Lysol, Original or Fresh
13 (12/180z/case) CASE $ 7495 $ 39.42
14 Disinfectant; Shower Patrol, (12/320z/cs) QUART $ 5.87 no bid
15 Disinfectant; Whistle Liguid Ammonia, (4galics) QUART $ 6.15 no bid
16 Clorox Uitra, (6/960z/cs) CASE $ 18.14 § 19.78
17 Cleaner - Degreaser; Orange All, (4gal/cs) CASE $ 5750 3 76.86
18 Wash & Wax; (4gal/cs) CASE $ 4860 $ 44.91
19 Stainless steel cleaner water base (12/160z/cs) CASE $ 5025 $ 68.47
20 Stainless steel cleaner oil base (12/150z/cs) CASE $ 7090 $ 74.17
21 Vinyl leather dressing, 448 Life Guard, (4gal/cs) GALLON $ 28.55 no bid
22 Glass cleaner, Windex 90940, (4galfcs) CASE $ 5980 $ 104.29
CLEANERS - DISINFECTANTS - GREEN PRODUCTS
Cleaner; concentrate, heavy duty for toilet bowls and
urinals and other restroom hard surfaces, <1% VOC's,
1 Biodegradable, green seal certified, 4 gallon/case 4 GAL/CS $ 78.00 no bid

All purpose cleaner, O-VOC's, Biodegradable, green
2 seal certified, 4 gallon/case 4 GAL/CS $ 78.00 no bid



Neutral disinfectant cleaner, effective against HiV-1, HIV.
2, Hepatitus B, & other infectous diseases, bacteria,
3 molds and fungus. Green seal certified, 4 gallon/case

Air freshener, ordor control for cccupancy, smoke &
stale air odors. 4/gal/cs. Concentrate, Not a spray
4 aerosol. Green seal certified, 4 gallon/case

Cleaner - Degreaser; Low VOC's, non foxic, heavy duty
cleaner of grease and oil from kitchen floors and other
5 hard surfaces, green seal certified, 4 gallonfcase

Glass & window cleaner, Low VQC's, non toxic,
6 biodegradable, green seal certified, 4 gallon/case

CLEANING PADS/WIPES

Whypall Plus 5740 blue wiper, pop up box, 9/100 case,
1 (9/100/cs)

Lysol Sanitizing Wipe, pop up dispenser 80 count,
2 12/case,

3 D-Bug pad,

4 Scour Pad 86HD, 3M, (3/12/cs)

5 Scour Pad 86 RG, 3M, (3/20/cs)
HAND SOAP

1 Soap; liguid hand pink hand soap (6gal/cs)

2 Soap; liquid hand, Sanifresh #91246, 800ml. 12/case
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3 E-2 Cleanser, Sanifresh (4/800ml/case)

4 Gentle Lotion, Sanifresh 800 ml. 12/case
5 Gentle Lotion, Sanifresh 500 ml. 12/case
6 Soap - dispenser 800ml in-sight smoke

7 Antibacterial Softsoap (4 gallon/case)

Hand cleaner, natural orange, Goje Industries No. 7255,
8 4/2000ml/pack,

FLOOR WAX, STRIPPERS, SCRUB PADS
Floor wax, high gloss, high durability, copolymer blend,
buffable, strippable with conventional procedures,
1 minimum solid content 25% at +/- 0.5% (4gal/cs)
2 17" Stripper Floor Pad
3 17" Polish Floor Pad
LINERS
1 Liner; 24" X 24", .8mil, 500/case
2 Liner; 24" X 30", 1.35mil, 250/case

Liner; 33 gal cap, 33" X 39", high molecular weight, high
3 density poly, 17 micron, 250/case

Liner; 33 gal cap, 33" X 39", black hi-density 19 micron,
4 250/case
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Liner; 33 gai cap, 33" X 39" low-density, XH, MB33X,
5 5711035, 3 mil (100/case),

Liner; 55 gal cap, 36" X 55", high molecular weight, high
6 density poly, 17 microns, 200/case

Liner; 55 gal cap, 36" X 50", low density poly 2.0mil
7 (100/cs)

8 Liner; 55 gal cap, 37" X 55", MB55 (100/cs),
9 Liner; 55 gal cap, 38" X 58", 1.9mil, L38519 (100/cs)

Liner; 55 gal cap, 36" X 50", heavy duty, MBS0X
10 (100/cs), 3+mil, (100/cs)

TOOLS - JANITORIAL
1 Broom; premium broom, 5 strand

Broom; janitor broom, 6 sew, janitor broom, premier M &
2B

Mop handie; jr. size, standard duty, quick change, 63" X
3 1.5" wood handle

Mop handle; sr. size, heavy duty steel handle, metal
4 head, 63" X 1" Rubbermaid

Mop handle; H148, invader gray, yellow head,
5 Rubbermaid

mop head; 240z string, cotton blue, 4 play, 1" headband
6 blue, Rubbermaid

7 Mop head; 160z string
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8 Mop head; 12 oz string

Dust mop refill, 24" X 5", looped end, cotton,
9 launderable

10 Dust mop refill, 36" x 5", looped end, cotton, launderable

11 Dust mop J152, 18" X 5", yellow,
12 Dust Mop Frame, 18"

13 Dust Mop Fram, 36" Frame

14 Dust mop handle, snap on

15 366330, moss floor squeege, 30",
16 Toilet bowl brush, black nylon, 20"

17 Combo pack, bucket & wringer

18 Spray trigger, contour trigger sprayer, impact (9-7/8"}

19 Spray trigger, contour trigger sprayer, impact (8-1/2")
20 Spray bottole, 5032A8, 320z

21 Spray botile, 5032AB, 240z

22 Latex gloves, large medical grade exam gloves

23 Latex gloves, medium medical grade exam gloves

24 Latex gloves, small medical grade exam gloves
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PAPER PRODUCTS

Paper towels, single play, multi-fold 9.4 X 9.25,
1 {4000/cs) CASE $ 2810 § 22.57

Paper towels, single play, 9.4" X 9.2", 16/250/cs, white
2 multi-fold CASE $ 2235 § 22.57

Paper towels, single play, smooth white, 8" X 6.25",
3 12/rollfcase CASE % 5420 $ 28.63

Paper towels, single ply, smooth white, approx 8" X
4 625', 12/roll/lcase, Post Consumer Waste 75% Minimum CASE no bid $ 28.63

Paper towels, two ply, smaooth white,
5 90sheets/30rolls/case CASE $ 3540 % 46.74

Paper Towels, fwo ply, smooth white, approx 11" X 8",
90 sheets/30roll/case, Post Consumer Waste 20%

& Minimum CASE % 5365 §% 46.74
Paper toilet seat cover, 5,000/case, Post Consumer
Waste Content 35% Minimum and All other

7 manufacturer physical qualities for this product CASE s 32.05 no bid

8 Paper toilet seat cover, 5000/cs CASE $ 3205 no bid
Toilet tissue, 2 play rating, 605sheets/roll, 80roll/cs,

9 45Ibs., 4-1/2" X 4-1/2" CASE $ 5095 $ 53.85
Toilet tissue, 2 play rating, 605 sheets/roll, 80rollfcs,

10 45Ibs., 4-1/2" X 4-1/2", Post Consumer Waste 80% Min CASE $ 6475 $ 53.85

11 Toilet tissue, 5" X 4", 60/400cs CASE $ 58.75 $ 53.85



Toilet Tissue; rolls, 3" X 4", Post Consumer Waste 80%
12 Minimum, 60/400/case

Toilet Tissue; pack, 8.5" X 4.5", 250 pkg, 36 pkg/case, 2
ply, Kimberly Clark #48280, (245011} Post Consumer
13 Waste 90% Minimum, Tinsel Strength

Toilet Tissue; pack, 8.5" X 4.5", 250 pkg, 36 pka/case, 2
14 ply, Post Consumer Waste 30% minimum
TISSUE DISPENSERS
1 57120 Chrome dual roiler tissue dispenser, 8705515,
2 Double roll tissue dispenser

Tentative low bidder - In Boid

Opened by:

Witnessed by:

(LA~ —~—
Greg King, Central Purchasing Agent
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