

BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M., April 26, 2016

JOB TITLE:

Furnishing and Delivery of Six Large Rotary Mowers

and Three Slope Mowers

IFB No. 15-16/P-99

ITEM NO. 1 (6 Rotary Mowers)	American Machinery	B. Hayman	Kut Kwick	Ness Turf Equip.	Pacific Golf and Turf
YEAR, MAKE & MODEL	2016 John Deere	Jacobsen	No bid	Toro Groundsmaster	John Deere
UNIT PRICE	\$53,611.12	\$61,942.31		\$64,094.80	\$57,866.01
NET TOTAL OUTRIGHT PURCHASE PRICE	\$321,666.72	\$371,653.86		\$384,568.80	\$347,196.09
DELIVERY DAYS	120.00	90.00		120.00	
ITEM NO. 2 (3 Slope Mowers)					
YEAR, MAKE & MODEL	No Bid	No Bid	Kut Kwick	Harper	No Bid
UNIT PRICE			\$68,653.00	\$50,551.76	
NET TOTAL OUTRIGHT PURCHASE PRICE			\$205,959.00	\$151,655.25	
DELIVERY DAYS			45	120	

Tentative low bidder - In Bold

Bid Summaries emailed to:

Managing Director

Director of Finance

Corporation Counsel

Director of Parks & Recreation

Council Chairman

Risk Management

Budget Director

Bid Documents To: Karla Peters

Source of Funds: 915686C/7105

Opened by:

Witnessed by:

Greg King

Jared Masuda

Greg King, Central Purchasing Agent