

**Tires and Tubes FY17  
Preliminary Bid Results  
Bid Opening: 6/23/16 @ 2:00 p.m.**

Item #	Item Description	Qty	Commercial Tire			Tire Rescue			Servco Tire			Valley Isle Motors		
			Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import
<b>PART I - PRICES SHALL INCLUDE STATE TAX AND FREIGHT AND DELIVERY CHARGES, FOB BIDDER'S PLACE OF BUSINESS. PRICES SHALL NOT INCLUDE COST OF TIRE DISPOSAL</b>														
<b>PART I - UNMOUNTED TIRES COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI PASSENGER CAR TIRES</b>														
1	P195-60R15	8	\$76.63	HERC ROADTOUR	S	\$53.99	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$63.42	Toyo Ext	S	\$75.19	GDY RS-A	S
2	P195-65R15	8				\$57.86	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$68.76	Toyo Ext	S	\$62.32	KELLY EDGE	I
3	P205-60R15	8				\$59.50	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$80.13	Toyo Ext	S	\$77.82	HAN OPTIMO	I
4	P205-65R15	8	\$80.44	HERC MRX IV	S	\$54.84	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$74.93	Toyo Ext	S	\$66.43	KELLY EDGE	I
5	P215-75R15	40	\$85.18	HERC MRX IV	S	\$65.76	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$78.49	Toyo Ext	S	\$100.26	GDY ASSUR	I
6	P225-70R15	8	\$96.24	HERC MRX IV	S				\$85.93	Toyo Ext	S	\$86.48	HAN OPTIMO	I
7	P225-75R15	24	\$96.64	COOP TRENDSETTER	S				\$88.00	Toyo Ext	S	\$85.59	HAN OPTIMO	I
8	P235-75R15	40							\$90.35	Toyo Ext	S	\$86.81	HAN OPTIMO	I
9	P205-60R16	8				\$58.28	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$84.08	Toyo Ext	S	\$72.30	KELLY EDGE	I
10	P215-60R16	8				\$65.76	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$86.27	Toyo Ext	S	\$88.77	HAN OPTIMO	I
11	P215-70R16	8				\$85.48	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$89.45	TB Wlid Trl	S	\$91.56	KELLY EDGE	I
12	P225-60R16	8				\$67.21	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$89.79	Toyo Ext	S	\$90.72	GDY INTEGRITY	S
13	P225-75R16	8	\$113.57	HERC MR IV	S				\$129.00	Toyo OPHT	S	\$122.84	FRS LES DES	I
14	P235-70R16	8	\$135.42	HERC CROSS-V	S	\$170.27	GY EAG RSA	import	\$105.00	TB Wlid Trl	S			
15	P245-70R16	8							\$120.26	Toyo OPHT	S	\$129.85	GEN HTS60	I
16	P235-70R17	8							\$143.93	Toyo OPHT	S	\$146.42	GEN HTS60	I
17	P235-75R17	8							\$156.79	Toyo OPHT	S	\$161.69	GEN HTS	I
18	P245-65R17	8							\$106.46	TB Wlid Trl	S	\$127.33	GDY FORTERA	I
19	P245-70R17	8							\$107.89	TB Wlid Trl	S			
20	P255-65R17	8	\$166.14	HERC ROADTOUR	S				\$163.52	Toyo OPHT	S	\$157.68	HAN DYNAPRO	I
21	P265-70R17	8							\$150.37	Toyo OPHT	S	\$151.50	GEN HTS60	I
Unit Price to Mount, Dismount & Balance Items #1-#14 above (Price shall not be considered in determining the low bidder)						\$24.99			\$25.00					

PART I - UNMOUNTED TIRES COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI LIGHT TRUCK - HIGHWAY													
22	LT235-75R15C	50	\$124.48	ELDARADO	S	\$134.55	GY WRL Dura	import	\$124.86	Toyo OPHT	S		
23	LT225-75R16D	12	\$150.28	HERC CROSS-V	S				\$108.77	TB Wild Trl	S		
24	LT235-70R16E	10							NO BID				
25	LT235-85R16E	40	\$140.82	CAPITAL H/T	S	\$135.29	GY WRL SRA	import	\$122.67	TB Wild Trl	S		
26	LT245-75R17	30	\$150.39	CAPITAL H/T		\$158.01	GY WRL SRA	import	\$136.32	TB Wild Trl	S		
27	LT245/70R17	8	\$148.21	CAPITAL H/T	S	\$153.24	GY WRL SRA	import	\$134.96	TB Wild Trl	S		
28	LT255/70R17	8							NO BID				
29	LT265/70R17	8	\$153.05	HERC MR IV	S	\$165.29	GY WRL SRA	import	\$152.78	TB Wild Trl	S		
30	LT265-75R16E	40	\$162.26	CAPITAL H/T	S	\$145.11	GY WRL SRA	import	\$139.60	TB Wild Trl	S		
31	LT275/65R18	8				\$177.41	GY WRL SRA	import	\$214.93	Toyo OPHT	S		
32	LT225-70R19.5F	18	\$167.72	HERC H902	S	\$177.08	Daewoo dw317	import	\$155.81	SU LM216	S		

Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import
PART I - UNMOUNTED TIRES COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI BIAS PLY HIGHWAY														
33	6.50 x 16LT-CTT	10	\$96.58	POWERKING	S				\$85.52	TB PK HWY	S			
34	7.50 x 16LT-DTT	16	\$125.46	POWERKING	S				\$114.22	TB PK HWY	S			
35	9.50 x 16.5LT-E	4	\$138.75	POWERKING	S				\$128.64	TB PK HWY	S			
36	12 x 16.5LT-G-H	6	\$221.76	SAMSON	S				\$204.89	TB PK HWY	S			

PART I - UNMOUNTED TIRES COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI LIGHT TRUCK AT'S														
37	LT235-75R15C	8	\$136.17	HERC ATII	S				\$138.90	Toyo OPAT	S			
38	LT225-75R16	8	\$143.92	FEDERAL	S	\$151.35	GY AT Advent		\$145.22	Toyo OPAT	S			
39	LT235-70R16	8							NO BID					
40	LT265-75R16E	40	\$159.21	IRONMAN	S	\$158.27	GY AT Advent		\$173.99	Toyo OPAT	S			
41	LT235-85R16E	40	\$144.53	CAPITAL A/T	S	\$152.39	GY AT Advent		\$153.03	Toyo OPAT	S			
42	LT245-75R17	8	\$191.86	HERC ATII	S	\$163.43	GY AT Advent		\$184.13	Toyo OPAT	S			
43	LT245-70R17	8	\$166.11	HERC ATII	S	\$157.69	GY AT Advent		\$165.32	Toyo OPAT	S			
44	LT255-70R17	8							NO BID					
45	LT265-70R17	8	\$159.08	IRONMAN	S	\$174.93	GY AT Advent		\$191.00	Toyo OPAT	S			
46	LT275-65R18	8	\$220.21	HERC ATII	S	\$184.02	GY AT Advent		\$236.45	Toyo OPAT	S			
47	LT225-70R19.5F	18	\$181.84	HERC H803	S				\$161.55	TB Dync Y501	S			
48	LT225-70R19.5	8	\$181.84	HERC H803	S				\$161.55	TB Dync Y501	S			

PART I - UNMOUNTED TIRES COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI HEAVY TRUCK - HIGHWAY														
49	10.00-20	8	\$240.76	POWERKING	S				\$369.46	DN Cargo Hwy	S			
50	255-70R22.5L (16 ply)	10	\$220.66	HERC H902	S				\$244.42	LM216	S			
51	385-65R22.5	8	\$440.90	HERC H402	S				\$484.51	LM128	S			
52	315-80R 22.5J (20 ply)	14	\$392.66	D-COIN RR680	S				\$320.81	LM216	S			
53	10R 22.5	4	\$307.50	HERC S205	S	\$364.78	GY G662	import	\$370.44	TB TR619	S			
54	11R 22.5H	20	\$284.75	HERC H502	S	\$302.08	GY G662	import	\$280.20	LM216	S			
55	12R 22.5H	60	\$389.74	SUMI ST727	S	\$437.27	GY G661	import	\$373.28	MN216	S			
56	425-65R 22.5L	10	\$504.88	HERC H402	S	\$642.33	GY G296 MSA	import	\$580.00	LM128	S			
57	11R 24.5H	30	\$300.71	HERC H502	S	\$315.62	Daewoo DW311	stock	\$294.61	LM216	S			

PART I - UNMOUNTED TIRES COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI HEAVY TRUCK - TRACTION														
58	315-80R22.5	8	\$486.81	SUMI ST908	I				\$330.00	LM302	S			
59	11R 22.5H	20	\$283.39	HERC H703	S	\$392.99	GY G622	import	\$298.68	LM516	S			
60	12R 22.5H	20	\$431.42	SUMI ST908	S				\$501.07	LM306	S			
61	11R 24.5H	30	\$303.13	HERC H703	S				\$316.44	LM516	S			

Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import
PART I - UNMOUNTED TIRES COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI HEAVY TRUCK MUD DEEP LUG														
62	315-80R22.5	20							NO BID					
63	11R 22.5H	20	\$318.74	HERC H307	S				\$326.00	LM305	S			
64	12R 22.5H	60	\$522.99	SUMI ST900	I				\$550.00	LM306	S			
65	11R 24.5H	30	\$336.53	HERC H307	S				\$330.00	LM306	S			

PART I - UNMOUNTED TIRES COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI TRAILER TIRES														
66	215/75R x 17.5TR-H	10	\$144.57	HERC H902	S				\$175.40	TB Dync Y203	S			
67	255/70R x 22.5H	10	\$220.66	HERC H902	S				\$244.42	LM216	S			
68	ST235-80R16	8	\$112.06	HERC	S	\$137.87	noble NB809	import	\$84.80	TB Towmax	S			
69	ST235-85R16	8	\$137.76	HERC	S	\$145.51	noble NB809	import	\$186.80	DN Adv GI285T	S			
70	9-16.5	8							\$128.64	TB Pk Hwy	S			

PART I - UNMOUNTED TIRES  
COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI  
TRACTOR & OFF ROAD

71	13.6-24	8	\$382.23	BKT R-1	S				\$343.60	TB Bkt Tr135	S		
72	20 x 10 x 10 NHS	10	\$86.20	CARLISLE TURF TRAC	S				\$78.27	TB Lg Turf	S		
73	13.6-28	8							\$431.61	TB Bkt Tr135	S		
74	14-17.5	4	\$332.28	POWERKING	S				\$311.57	TB Pwk HD	S		
75	11Lx16 (10 ply)	6	\$210.20	SOLIDEAL F-3	S				\$160.50	TB Hvk PM F3	S		
76	10 x 16.5 NHS (8 ply)	12	\$153.54	POWERKING	S				\$159.64	TB PK XD+	S		
77	12 x 16.5 NHS (8 ply)	8	\$173.25	POWERKING	S				\$162.16	TB PK XD+	S		
78	26x12.00x12	8	\$132.41	CARLISLE MULTI TRAC	S				\$75.84	TB Lg Turf	S		
79	13.00 x 24G (12 ply)	6	\$506.90	SOLIDEAL G-2	S				\$464.97	TB PK Grdr	S		
80	6.50-16	8							\$92.44	TB BKT TF9090	S		
81	20.5 x 25L-2TL (16 ply)	4							\$1,151.02	TB PK Ind Grp2	S		
82	20.5 x 25 HRL (16 ply)	4							\$1,198.05	TB PK Ind Grp	S		
83	23.5 x 25-3L (16 ply)	4	\$1,414.39	POWERKING E-3	S				\$1,601.69	TB PK Ind Grp L2	S		
84	23.5 x 25 SGL (16 ply)	4							\$1,601.93	TB PK Ind Grp E	S		

PART I - RECAP TRUCK TIRES  
COUNTY GARAGE AT WAILUKU, MAUI  
OR CENTRAL MAUI LANDFILL  
(MDI Xray Machine Required to submit a bid for this section)

85	W.H.L. Recap zero ply 315/80 R 22.5 (this item only delivery to Central Maui Landfill)	20	\$305.80	BANDAG BDM (WHL)	I				\$345.99	RECAP WHL	S		
86	315/80R 22.5 (20 ply, W.H.L)	60	\$305.80	BANDAG BDM (WHL)	I				\$345.99	RECAP BDM	S		
87	11R/24.5 (16 ply, W.H.L)	20	\$297.10	BANDAG BDM (WHL)	I				\$340.10	RECAP BDM	S		
88	12R/22.5 (16 ply, W.H.L)	20	\$295.65	BANDAG BDM (WHL)	I				\$314.20	RECAP BDM	S		
89	11R/22.5 (16 ply, W.H.L)	20	\$174.19	BANDAG BDM (WHL)	I				\$306.19	RECAP BDM	S		

Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import
<b>PART III - PRICES SHALL INCLUDE STATE TAX AND FREIGHT AND DELIVERY CHARGES, FOB BIDDER'S PLACE OF BUSINESS. PRICES SHALL NOT INCLUDE COST OF TIRE DISPOSAL</b>														
PART III - UNMOUNTED TIRES DEPARTMENT OF WATER SUPPLY PASSENGER CAR TIRES														
90	P215/70/R15	20	\$80.08	ELDARADO	S	\$55.71	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$77.55	Toyo Ext	S			
91	P225/70/R15	10	\$96.24	HERC MRX IV	S				\$85.93	Toyo Ext	S	\$86.48	HAN OPTIMO	I
92	P225/75/R16	15	\$113.57	HERC MR IV	S				\$129.00	TOYO OPHT	S	\$122.84	FRS LE2 DEST	I
93	P255/70/R16	20	\$122.93	TERRAMAX	S				\$120.42	TB Wild trl	S	\$138.27	FRS LE2 DEST	I
94	P245/65/R17	8							\$120.98	TB Wild trl	S	\$158.73	FRS LE2 DEST	I
95	P255/75/R17	10							NO BID			\$181.02	GDY SR-A	S
96	P225/60/R16	10	\$79.36	TERRAMAX	S	\$67.21	GY ASSUR A/S	import	\$89.79	Toyo Ext	S	\$90.72	GDY INTEGRITY	S
PART III - UNMOUNTED TIRES DEPARTMENT OF WATER SUPPLY LIGHT TRUCK AT/S TRACTION														
97	LT235/75/R15(C)	20	\$125.06	IRONMAN AT	S				\$138.90	Toyo OPAT	S			
98	LT225/75/R16(E)	8	\$131.57	IRONMAN AT	S	\$151.75	GY WRL Adv AT	import	\$145.22	Toyo OPAT	S			
99	LT235/85/R16(E)	20	\$145.36	IRONMAN AT	S	\$152.39	GY WRL Adv AT	import	\$153.03	Toyo OPAT	S			
100	LT245/75/R16(E)	10	\$164.46	IRONMAN AT	S	\$150.82	GY WRL Adv AT	import	\$165.58	Toyo OPAT	S			
101	LT265/75/R16(E)	40	\$193.39	HERC ATII	S	\$158.27	GY WRL Adv AT	import	\$174.70	Toyo OPAT	S			
102	LT265/70/R17(E)	40	\$178.71	IRONMAN AT	S	\$174.93	GY WRL Adv AT	import	\$227.05	Toyo OPAT	S			
103	31x10.50R15LT(C)	4	\$157.97	HERC ATII	S	\$140.54	GY WRL Adv AT	import	\$147.17	Toyo OPAT	S			
PART III - UNMOUNTED TIRES DEPARTMENT OF WATER SUPPLY LIGHT TRUCK HEAVY TRACTION														
104	LT/235/80/R17(E)	20	\$187.58	IRONMAN	S				NO BID					
105	LT265/75/R16(E)	20	\$232.72	HERC MT	S				\$177.74	TB Mud Claw	S			
106	LT265/70R17(E)	20	\$224.99	HERC MT	S				\$220.38	TB Mud Claw	S			
107	LT245/75/R16(E)	6	\$233.32	HERC MT	S				\$175.67	TB Mud Claw	S			
PART III - UNMOUNTED TIRES DEPARTMENT OF WATER SUPPLY HEAVY TRUCK HIGHWAY														
108	900.20 TUBE TIRE	4							\$205.56	TB PK AP Hwy	S			
109	11R22.5(H)	12	\$284.75	HERC H502	S	\$302.08	daewoo DW311	import	\$280.20	SU LM216	S			
110	11R24.5(H)	30	\$300.71	HERC H502	S	\$315.62	daewoo DW311	import	\$294.61	SU LM216	S			
111	295/75R225	2	\$276.58	HERC H902	S				\$260.19	SU LM216	S			
112	225-70/R19.5 14 PLY	20	\$167.72	HERC H902	S				\$155.81	SU LM216	S			
113	245-70/R19.5 14 PLY	8	\$187.86	HERC H902	S				\$180.01	SU LM216	S			

Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import
PART III - UNMOUNTED TIRES DEPARTMENT OF WATER SUPPLY HEAVY TRUCK TRACTION														
114	11R22.5(H)	6	\$283.39	HERC H703	S	\$392.99	GY G622		\$326.00	LM305	S			
115	11R24.5(H)	40	\$303.13	HERC H703	S				\$340.80	SU LM306	S			
116	225/70/R19.5(G)	30	\$179.82	HERC H803	S	\$245.99	GY G622		\$161.55	TB Dync Y501	S			
117	245/70/R19.5 14 PLY	6	\$199.99	HERC H803	S	\$265.00	GY G622		NO BID					
PART III - UNMOUNTED TIRES DEPARTMENT OF WATER SUPPLY TRAILER TIRES														
118	LT235/85/R16, 14 PLY, LOAD RANGE 3042 SINGLE DUAL 2778, SIDE WALL 1 PLY STEEL, THREAD PLYS 4 STEEL	16	\$187.49	HERC H901	S				\$186.80	DN Adv GI285T	S			
119	B78/13(ST175/80D13) 6 PLY	10	\$58.80	TRAILKING	S				\$55.02	TB Sld Trl	S			
120	700/14 6 PLY	10							\$82.96	TB PK Hwy	S			
121	225/75/15 8 PLY	8	\$93.73	SOLIDTRAC	S				\$92.22	TB Sld Trl	S			
122	700/15 10 PLY	4	\$104.54	POWERKING	S				\$105.32	TB PK Hwy	S			
123	650/16 6 PLY	4	\$96.58	POWERKING	S				\$85.52	TB PK Hwy	S			
124	750/16 10 PLY	4	\$125.46	POWERKING	S				\$120.54	TB PK Hwy	S			
125	215/75/R17.5 16 PLY	30	\$144.57	HERC H902	S				\$175.40	TB Dync Y203	S			
126	10R/17.5 16 PLY	12	\$241.95	HERC H205	S				\$351.04	TB Sumi	S			
PART III - UNMOUNTED TIRES DEPARTMENT OF WATER SUPPLY BACKHOE TRACTOR														
127	6-12 TRACTION 4 PLY	1							\$60.10	TB Super Lug	S			
128	12.4-16 4 PLY	1							NO BID					
129	11L-16SL 10 PLY	4	\$199.18	SOLIDEAL	S				\$160.50	TB Hvk PM Bkh	S			
130	12-16.5 NHS 10 PLY	16	\$173.25	POWERKING	S				\$162.16	TB Hvk Pwr Lug	S			
131	12.5-80-18 12 PLY	4	\$294.74	HARVESTKING	S				\$278.03	TB Hvk Pwr Lug	S			
132	9.5-24 GRIP LUG 6 PLY	1							\$222.29	TB Bkt Trl35	S			
133	16.9-24 10 PLY	2	\$533.37	SOLIDEAL	S				\$581.14	TB Hvk	S			
134	17.5L-24 10 PLY	2							\$690.43	TB Hvk	S			
135	19.5L-24 12 PLY	2	\$621.66	SOLIDEAL	S				\$629.77	TB Hvk Ind R-4	S			
136	21L-24 12 PLY	4							\$890.48	TB Hvk Ind R-4	S			
137	17.5-25 16 PLY	2							\$864.05	TB Pk Ind Ldr L2	S			
138	13.6-28 6 PLY	1							\$501.88	TB Bkt Trl35	S			
139	14.9-28 6 PLY	1							\$580.72	TB Bkt Trl35	S			
140	26X12.00-12 4 PLY	1	\$132.41	CARLISLE	S				NO BID					
141	18X9.50-10 4 PLY	1							NO BID					

Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import
PART III - UNMOUNTED TIRES DEPARTMENT OF WATER SUPPLY FORK LIFT TIRES														
142	6.00-9 10 PLY	1	\$70.53	SOLIDEAL	S				\$62.86	TB Ind D301	S			
143	650-10 10 PLY	1	\$83.15	SOLIDEAL	S				\$75.12	TB Ind D301	S			
144	28-9-15 14 PLY	4	\$224.35	SOLIDEAL	S				\$314.91	EBT Tf Dawg Lug	S			
145	8.15-15 14 PLY	16							\$197.56	TB Ind Prem	S			
146	700-12 12 PLY	4	\$125.78	SOLIDEAL	S				\$126.92	TB Ind D301	S			
147	700-10 12 PLY	1							NO BID					
148	8.25-15 12 PLY	2	\$238.68	SOLIDEAL	S				\$265.07	TB Ind D301	S			
PART IV - PRICES SHALL INCLUDE STATE TAX AND FREIGHT AND DELIVERY CHARGES, FOB BIDDER'S PLACE OF BUSINESS, AND SHALL INCLUDE COST OF TIRE DISPOSAL														
PART IV - UNMOUNTED TIRES KAHULUI FIRE STATION AT KAHULUI, MAUI HEAVY DUTY TIRES														
149	315/80R 22.5 L Steering 65 mph Michelin XZY3 or approved equal (e.g. Bridgestone or Goodyear)	18	\$846.70	GY G751	I				\$866.00	BS M806A	S			
150	385/65R 22.5 J Steering 65 mph Michelin XZY3 WB or approved equal (e.g. Bridgestone or Goodyear)	10	\$784.61	GY G296	I				\$800.85	BS M854	S			
151	425/65R 22.5 L G296, 65 mph	10	\$787.33	GY G296	I				\$1,075.46	BS M860A	S			
152	425/65R 22.5 H Michelin XFE Front, 65 mph	2	\$787.33	GY G296	I				\$1,042.63	BS M860A	S			
153	445/65R 22.5 L G286 65 mph	2	\$879.51	GY G296	I				\$1,171.28	BS M854	S			
154	9R22.5 G149	2							\$465.60	BS R250F	S			
155	9R22.5 G622 (F)	4							NO BID					
156	11R22.5 Steer	2							\$676.00	BS R250ED	S			
157	11R 22.5 H Drive/Steering 65 mph Michelin XZY3 or approved equal (e.g. Bridgestone or Goodyear)	12	\$629.57	GY G731	I				\$715.45	BS M843	S			
158	12R 22.5 H Drive/Steering 65 mph Michelin XZY3 or approved equal (e.g. Bridgestone or Goodyear)	20	\$742.98	GY G731	I				\$819.01	BS M843	S			
159	12R24.5H G177 65 mph	8	\$763.82	GY G177	I				NO BID					
160	16.00R20XZLTLRM	6							NO BID					

Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import
PART IV - UNMOUNTED TIRES KAHULUI FIRE STATION AT KAHULUI, MAUI LIGHT TRUCK TIRES														
161	LT215/85R16 E Goodyear AT/S M&S	2				\$149.76	GY wrl AT Adv	import	\$167.24	Toyo OPAT	S			
162	225/70R19.5 G Drive/Steering 65 mph MichelinXDS 2 or approved equal (e.g. Bridgestone or Good Year)	18	\$342.72	GY G622	I	\$245.99	GY G672	import	\$478.53	BS M729F	S			
163	LT225075R17 M&S	6							NO BID					
164	LT245-75R16E - All Terrain	4	\$208.66	HERC ATII	S	\$150.83	GY wrl AT Adv	import	\$167.76	Toyo OPAT	S			
165	LT265-75R16E - All Terrain	4	\$216.95	HERC ATII	S	\$158.27	GY WrlAT Adv	import	\$193.41	Toyo OPAT	S			
166	LT265-70R17 (Mud Terrain - Toyo, GY, Mich)	12	\$382.20	TOYO OPEN CNTRY	I	\$188.92	GY WRL MTR	import	\$325.28	Toyo OPAT	S			
167	265/70R19.5 G622	6							NO BID					
168	LT275/70R18E - All Terrain	4	\$242.99	HERC ATII	S	\$190.71	GY WRL AT Adv	import	\$256.73	Toyo OPAT	S			
169	LT275-70R18 (Mud Terrain - Toyo, GY, Mich)	8	\$427.67	TOYO M55	I	\$259.13	GY WRL MTR	import	\$349.88	Toyo OPMT	S			
PART IV - UNMOUNTED TIRES KAHULUI FIRE STATION AT KAHULUI, MAUI PASSENGER TIRES														
170	245-70R17 M&S	4							\$166.48	Toyo OPAT	S	\$216.18	MIC MS2 LTX	I
171	265-70R16 M&S	4							\$148.61	Toyo OPAT	S	\$195.48	MIC MS LTX	I
172	265-70R17 M&S	4							\$158.09	Toyo OPAT	S	\$223.78	MIC MS2 LTX	I
173	P-195/70R14 H-Rated	8							NO BID					
174	P225/60R16 97S	2							\$94.17	Toyo Ext	S	\$95.72	GDY INTEGRITY	S
175	P235/70R17 M&S	4							\$169.04	FS Dest AT	S	\$199.83	MIC MS2 LTX	I
176	P265/70R17 AT/S	4							\$158.09	Toyo OPAT	S	\$146.97	KELLY EDGE A	I
177	P265/70R18 Conti	4							\$206.89	Toyo OPAT	S	\$213.79	CON CONTITR	I
178	P265/65/R18 A/T	4							\$196.13	Toyo OPAT	S	\$215.95	FRS A/T DESTI	I
179	ST235-80R16 E	4	\$119.21	HERC	S				\$89.33	TB Towmax	S			



Item #	Item Description	Qty	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import	Unit Price	Brand/Make	Stock/Import
<b>PART V - PRICES SHALL INCLUDE STATE TAX AND FREIGHT AND DELIVERY CHARGES, FOB BIDDER'S PLACE OF BUSINESS, AND SHALL INCLUDE COST OF TIRE DISPOSAL</b>														
<b>PART V - POLICE FLEET TIRES MOUNTED AT VENDOR'S PLACE OF BUSINESS</b>														
180	P225/60R16, High Speed Police Tires, Radial Ply Design, 6 full plies consisting of 2 full carcass plies and 4 full belt plies. Manufacturer's certification for use at speeds of at least 125 MPH shall be provided. (Ford Crown Victoria)	60												
			\$284.25	FIRESTONE		S			\$270.00	FS PV41	S	\$292.29	GDY R-SA P	I
181	P235/50R18, High Speed Police Tires, All Season, with a minimum speed rating of (H), non directional (Chevy Caprice)	96												
			\$123.90	SUMITOMO		S			\$100.00	TB Vel Zxv4	S			
182	LT225/75R16 M&S (Ford & Chevy Van)	8	\$155.46	FEDERAL		S			\$145.00	TB Wild Tri Com	S			
183	LT235/75R15 M&S (Ford Explorer & Van)	12	\$138.26	HERC ATII		S			\$138.90	Toyo OPAT	S			
184	245/75R16 (Ford Van)	4	\$158.51	GEN GRABBER		S			\$150.00	TB Wild Tri Com	S			
185	P155/80R13 (GO-4 Three Wheeler)	6	\$63.19	IRONMAN GR906		S			\$55.84	Toyo Ext	S			
186	AT23X8-11 (ATV front)	12	\$110.00	CARLISLE AT489		S			NO BID					
187	AT24X9-11 (ATV back)	12	\$125.74	CARLISLE AT489		S			NO BID					
188	LT265/75R16 (Excursion)	4	\$152.41	TERRAMAX		S			\$189.19	Toyo OPHT	S			
189	225/70R19.9 (F450 Clan Lab Truck)	4	\$173.03	SAIL S637		S			\$155.81	Su LM216	S			
190	P215/60R16 (03 Taurus)	24	\$84.68	SAILUN		S			\$86.27	Toyo Ext	S	\$93.87	HAN OPTIMO	I
191	P235/55R17 (minimum H Rated - non directional)	200	\$107.23	SAILUN		S			\$115.00	TB Vel Zxv4	S	\$108.28	UNI GTZ A/S	I
192	LT 255170R16 MIS	20	\$150.17	HERC ATII		S			NO BID					
193	215165R16 (Toyota Van)	4							\$96.95	Toyo VSNR	S			
194	P265/70R17 All Terrain (Ford Expedition & Chevy Tahoe)	12	\$175.33	HERC ATII		S			\$151.09	Toyo OPAT	S			
195	LT275/70R18 (District Ford 350 Truck)	12	\$205.98	HERC ATII		S			\$249.73	Toyo OPAT	S			
196	LT245/70/R17 All Terrain (Ford 150 Truck)	8	\$178.40	HERC ATII		S			\$185.00	Toyo OPAT	S			
197	245/55R18 High Speed Police Tires, all season, min speed rating (H) Load Index (103), non directional Explorer	4							NO BID			\$273.49	GDY R-SA P	I
198	P255/50/R20 all season, min speed rating (H), load index(103) non directional. Explorer	4							NO BID			\$235.88	HAN VENTUS S1 NOBLE	I
199	P265/65R17 All Terrain, non directional Tacoma Tire	4	\$171.58	HERC ATII		S			\$186.00	Toyo OPAT	S	\$210.51	FRS AT DESTI	I
200	P265/70R16 All Terrain, non directional Tacoma Tire	4	\$161.66	HERC ATII		S			\$141.61	Toyo OPAT	S	\$178.01	FRS AT DESTI	I
201	LT275/70R18 Mud Terrain, non directional (District Ford 350)	4							\$342.88	Toyo OPMT	S			
	Unit Price to Mount, Dismount & Balance Items #179 - #200 above		\$20.00						\$25.00			\$24.00		

(This price shall be **added** to the cost of the tires to determine the low bidder)