BID RESULTS
COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE: 07/27/2016
JOB TITLE: Expendable Foodservice Products for Senior Services August 1, 2016 - Januﬁfy H, 2016)
IFB 16-17/P-3

Maui Chemical and Paper o OfficeMax/Hopaco

Section Quantity . - . Description- .= . Unit Price . ~Amount = Unit Price - - Amount :
KAUNCA :
Southland foam tray, five compartment, 8" A
1 60 CASE x 10", 500/case. TH1-0500, 5CMPT FOAM $50.02 $2,501.00° $47.00 $2,350.00;
TRAY, TENNECO e '
A) W710500 x
5 50 CASE Styrofoam tray with cover, medium, 3 $22.40 $1.120.003‘:’f $21.00 $1.050.00
compartments :

hinged lid, 200/case, TENNECO 80-215

AYWT7NT3
3 50 CASE Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack, $10.50 $525.00 $11.77
" 10 per case i
B) #3640 o
Plastic spoon, med. Weight, 1,000/case, 1 £25.00
4 50 CASE 100/pkg., 10/case $10.50 $525. N $10.00
B) #3642
Dispenser napkin, 8" x 13-1/2", 42 02 84040
5 20 CASE 10000/case, JR501 PY tall fold $42. $840. E $42.00
C) JR501
Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4", : e
6 10 CASE 500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721 $93.80 $938.00- - $66.00 $660.00
REYNOLDS o ko
OEG-100, disposable gloves, large, . :
7 20 CASE 4650530, 10 boxes/case {prefer pop-up - $14.93 $208.60 - $15.00 $300.00
no rolls)
A} W815261 ¥
8 20 CASE Food tray, 1/2 lb., 1/4000 $20.35 $407.00 - $22.75 $455.00°¢
9 1 CASE  Food tray, 11b., 1/1000 $25.10 $25.10 _ $26.25
10 10 CASE  Styrofoam bowls, 8oz. (F8 1100510} $50.45 $504.50 $50.00
B) DART 8S8J20 :
11 100 CASE Styrofoam cups, 6oz.,DART 6J6, 1000/cs $24.23  $2,423.00 $23.90

A)W7686



Plastic container, 5 oz. cup size, 1000/case $101.27

$6,600.00 ;

12a 60 CASE 4FK5CC $6,076.20 $110.00
B) #FK5CC ;
12b 60 CASE lv;llfiss Cfgr 5 oz. plastic container, 1000/case $92.26 $5,535.00 . $89.00 $5.340.00"
12 12A +128 $11,611.20 < $11.940.00
Dawn, Joy, Paimolive dish detergent, 10- . .
13 5 CASE 12 oz., assorted $41.55 $207.76 , ne bid no bid
14 2 CASE  Chopsticks, individual paper wrapped $61.60 $123.20 3',' $77.90 $155.8 i
15 10 CASE  Sugar, individual packets, 3000/case $13.65 $136.50 . $15.61 $156.1
Plastic Knife, med.-heavy weight, 10.5 o .
16 10 CASE 100/pack, 10 per case $10.50 s10.505:‘ $11.77 $117.70;
B) #3641 :
17 10 CASE  Tea bags, 100/box, 10 boxes/case no bid no bid i no bid
18 10 CASE _ Clorox, 16 oz. (or 5 case 32 0z.) bottles $27.98 $27.98 &
A) W32071 .
i
19 2 CASE  Plastic Sandwich Bag, Zip Lock Top $20.42 $40.84- $16.75 $33.50 i
A) W4F20406 : b
20 5CASE  Press & seal wrap, dispenser ty box $13.40 $67.00 no bid no bid
B} VALUE WRAP
Biodegradable, covered 3 compariment 47 .16 71560 :_f
21 10CASE oy, paper. $47. $471.60° - $42.69 $426.90,
Ay W7HL83
22 5CASE 5.5 0z White Baking Cup, 500/bx, 20bx/cs $76.42 $377.10. o bid no bid :
AWTTL1S '
LANAI. - . _
1 10 CASE 5 compartment lunch tray, foam 8" x 10" $60.85 $608.50° $58.95 $5689.50
A) W710500 . £
Plastic sandwich bag 8X8, 2.0 mil 67.30 134 60:
22CASE  ZipLOCK 1000/case $67. $134. $59.30  $11880;
A) W4F20808 o
2 10 CASE Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack, $11.93 $11930 $15.90 $158.00

10 packs/case
A)Y W7A10000825



4 2 CASE

5 1 CASE

6 20 CASE

7 2 CASE

8 4 CASE

9 4 CASE

10 2 CASE

11 10 CASE

12 2 CASE

13 20 CASE

14 4 CASE

15 2 CASE

16 2 CASE

~ poly, 1.75 mil, 200 bag/case

Dispenser napkins, 8" x 13-1/2", $46.68

10000/case, SCOTT 98710
A) WBST713

Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4",
500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721 $103.18

$93.36

REYNOLDS
A)W8J10003028

Styrofoam deep trays with cover, 3
compartments, 200/case, AMOCO #80- $24.64

$103.18 '

$492.80

663
A) W7DF883PB

OEG-100 disposable gloves, large,
1000/case, 10 boxes/case, prefer pop-ups - $13.44

no rolls
A) W8B15261

Multi-fold paper towels, 9.4" x 9.25", white $28.38

$113.52

4000/case
A)WS5131761

Trash can liner, 33 gal., 33x39, low density $34.89

$139.56.."

A) KEPT334022B

Toilet tissue, rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheet/roll, 96 $67.17

B

rollsfcase
A} W5H513721

Paper hot cup, with handle, 8oz., $77.85

$134.34

1000/case
A)Y W7SDR8OLDW

Clorox disinfectant, 6 gallons/case $18.32

$778.50

$6.64

AY W32071

Paper plates, M23-7992, diamond deluxe,
12 pkg-20 trays each, 10-1/2 x 8-1/2x 1,5 $76.90

$1,538.00

compartment, luau tray
AYWTTL1S

Paper towei, roll, double ply $33.91

$135.64

A) WEST852

Tea bags, 100/box, 10 boxes/case no bid

no bid

A) AT00291

Plastic spoon, med. Weight, 100/pack, 10 $11.93

packsfcase
A) W7PTMWS10

$52.50

$82.50

$29.90

$20.00

$35.00

$33.00

$69.00

$70.00

$21.00

$79.00

$15.00

16.0




17 4 CASE  Press and seal wrap, dispenser type box $15.62 $62.48 - $18.00
A) WBVW182

18 20 CASE Biodegradable, 3 compartment covered
tray, paper

A)W7HLS3

$51.87  $1,037.40 . $53.90

19 5 CASE  8oz. Styrofoam bowl $55.50
A) WT7BFC20

20 5CASE  8oz. Styrofoam bowl lid $26.60
A) W7LVFC20

21 2 CASE  Cream - Individual serving packet $14.75
A) A700022

22 10 CASE  Styrofoam Cups, 6 oz., 1000/cs $25.62
A) WT76B6

-~ TOTAL LUMP SUM BID FOR ITEMS 1 -
CTHRU 245 o '

KALAUPAPA AND KAUNAKAKAI RN
"1 10 CASE~ Foam cups, 8 oz., foam cups, 1000/case $32.00 8320.00?_“1 $35.00
A) W78B8 "

Styrofoam deep try with cover, 3

2 40 CASE compartments, 200/case, AMOCO #80- $24 .84 $985.60: $29.90
663 =
Ay W7DF883PB
Southland foam trays, 5 compartments, 8" 5

310CASE o s00/case, AMOCO #70-255 $6085  $608507 $60.00
A) W710500
Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack, 1192 772

4 4 CASE 10 packsfcase 1.9 7. 15.90
A) W7A10000825
Plastic spoon, 5" 1000/case, LS-1, Winkler 1193 2386 .

52CASE  4947.005 $11. $23.88 $16.00
A} W7PTMWS10

6 2 CASE Dispenser napkins, 8" x 12-1/2", $46.68 $93.36 52.50

10000/case, SCOTT 98710
AYWEBST713



Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4",

$206.36 $82.50

7 2CASE 500 sheets/box, 8 boxes/case, 721 $103.18
REYNOLDS :
A} W8J10003028
OEG-100 disposable gloves, large, ‘
8 2CASE  1000/case, 10 boxes/case GAUN prefer $13.44 $26.88 $20.00 40.0
POpP-ups - no rolls )
A) W815261
Multi-fold paper towel, 9.4" x 9.25", white,
9 2 CASE 4000/case $28.38 $66.76 - $35.00 70.0
A} WS5131761
Toilet tissue: Kimberly Clark SS #0446,
10 2CASE  rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheet/roll, 96/case, 45Ibs., $67.17 $134.34 . $69.00 $138.0
4-1/12 x 4-1/2 :
Ay W5131721
Tea bags, 100/box - 10/box - 10 , , .
11 5 CASE boxesfcase no bid no bid . $8.00 40.0
A) AT00291 '
Paper plate, #22025 Valley, 5 26.90 269,00, e
1? 1,0 CASfErmc;@]Banment luau tray $76.9 $769. - $79.00 $790.00 .
A) W710500 o
Paper tray covered, bicdegradable, 3 51 87 $518 70‘ :
13 10 CASE compariment $51. 2. - $53.90
A} WT7HLS3
14 2 CASE  Trash Liner, low-density 33x39 MB 33 $34.89 $69.78 $33.00 $66.00 ;
A) K6PT334022b K i
15 2CASE  Clorox disinfectant, 6 gallons/case $18.32 $36.64. $21.00
A) W32071
Plastic Container, 502z cup, FKSCC, 111.39 292 78 B -
16 2CASE | ooniace $111. $222. .. $122.00 $244.uog. ‘
A) W7FKSECC
17 2CASE  Plastic lid, for 5 oz. cup, L6CC, 1000/case $101.47 $202.94 101.00 $202.00
A) W7LSCC
18 2 CASE  Sugar - individual packet, 2000/case $15.00 $30.00. $17.00 $34.00°
A) A700021 . o
Press and seal wrap, dispenser type, $15.62 $31.24 -
192CASE  yoma0 sq. ft./case $18.00 $36.00
A) WaVW182 i
T TGTAL LUMP SUM BID FOR ITEMS 1. *Did not bid 8ads S 760.60. -
L THRUAS: e e n o el ems $4,384.46 : i___ﬂ




Tentative low bidder - In Bold

Bid Summaries emailed to:
Managing Director
Director of Finance
Corporation Counsel
Council Chariman

Opened by: Greg King&a-""/\/l N

Witnessed by: Jared Masu

(/("'\———'\-‘

Greg King, Cen\ral Purchasing Agent




