BID RESULTS
COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE: 01/29/2019

JOB TITLE: Expendable Foodservice Products for Senior Services February 1, 2019 - July 31, 2019)
IFB 18-19/P-87

‘Maui Chemical

KAUNOA

3 compartment tray hinge w/lid,
1 10 CASE  polypropylene, earthchoice H/T White, $45.48 $454.80
200/cs, medium or similar

#2653592

Tray 5-compartment, fuau style, 10.5x8.5",
2 10 CASE compostable bagasse with plsatic/wax $96.82 $968.20
lining, 4/125/cs
#2656005
Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface
6/95 pop-up container
#38143814
Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack, $17.46 $873.00
10 per case
#1351050

3 5 CASE $34.52 $172.60

4 50 CASE

Plastic spoon, med. Weight, 1,000/case, $17.62 $881.00
100/pkg., 10/case

#1354050

Dispenser napkin, 8" x 13-1/2", $35.47 $709.40
10000/case, JR501 PY tall fold

#2054026

Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4",
7 10 CASE 500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721 $93.44 $934.40
. REYNOLDS

#0103539

OEG-100, disposable gloves, large,
8 20 CASE 4650530, 10 boxes/case (prefer pop-up - $13.77 $275.40
no rolls)

#4650538

9 20 CASE  Food tray, 1/2 Ib., 1/1000 $22.19 $443.80
#2652551

10 1 CASE  Food tray, 1 Ib., 1/1000 $27.20 $27.20
#2652552

Plastic container, 5 oz. cup size, 1000/case $149.66 $8,979.60
#FK5CC - :

#8131205

Lids for 5 oz. plastic container, 1000/case $137.87 $8,272.20
#L5CC :

#8131207
11 11A+ 11B $17,251.80

Dawn, Joy, Palmolive dish detergent, 10-12 NO BID
0z., assorted

5 50 CASE

6 20 CASE

11a 60 CASE

11b 60 CASE

12 5 CASE




13 2 CASE

14 10 CASE

15 10 CASE

16 10 CASE

17 10 CASE

18 2 CASE

19 5 CASE

20 10 CASE

21 5 CASE

22 10 CASE

23 10 CASE

24 10 CASE

1 10 CASE

2 10 CASE

3 2CASE

4 10 CASE

5 2 CASE

6 1 CASE

7 5 CASE

Chopsticks, individual paper wrapped
#1350510

Sugar, individual packets, 2000/case
#1203505

Plastic Knife, med.-heavy weight,
100/pack, 10 per case

#1352550

Tea bags, 100/box, 10 hoxes/case
#8123188

Clorox, 16 oz. (or 5 case 32 oz.) bottles
#4750512

Plastic Sandwich Bag, Zip Lock Top
#0258038

Press & seal wrap, dispenser ty box

3 compariment food tray hinge wilid,
compostable bagasse with wax lining,
primewear 2/80

#DPLA38
5.5 oz White Baking Cup, 500/bx, 20bx/cs

#8138403

Paper hot cup 8oz., single poly, white
20/50 1,000/cs

#1254538

Trash liner 33 gallon black high density
250/cs

#5750566

Trash Liner 55 gallon black high denisty
200/cs

#5750571

3 compartment fray hinge w/lid,
polypropylene, earthchoice H/T White,
200/cs, medium or similar

#2653592

Tray 5-compartment, luau style, 10.5x8.5",
compostable bagasse with plsatic/wax
lining, 4/125/cs

#2656005

Plastic sandwich bag 8X8, 2.0 mil
ZIPLOCK 1000/case

#0258040

Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack,
10 packs/case

#1351050

Dispenser napkins, 8" x 13-1/2",
10000/case, SCOTT 28710

#2054026

Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4",
500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721
REYNOLDS

#0103539

Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface
6/95 pop-up container

$66.25 $132.50
$14.59 $145.90
$16.62 $166.20
$16.34 $163.40
$30.68 $30.68
$19.71 $39.42
NO BID
$54.36 $543.60
$82.21 $411.05
$59.05 $690.50
$21.51 $215.10
$24.92 $249.20

$47.08 $470.80
$100.23 $1,002.30
$3436  $68.72
$18.07 $361.40
$36.72  $73.44
$102.78 $102.78
$37.97  $189.85




8 2 CASE

9 4 CASE

10 4 CASE

11 4 CASE

12 2 CASE

13 2 CASE

14 10 CASE

15 60 CASE

16 60 CASE

17 2 CASE

18 4 CASE

19 2 CASE

20 10 CASE

21 10 CASE

22 10 CASE

23 2 CASE

24 4 CASE

25 20 CASE

26 2 CASE

#8143814

OEG-100 disposable gloves, large,
1000/case, 10 boxes/case, prefer pop-ups - $16.16

$32.32

no rolls
#4650538
Multi-fold paper towels, 9.4" x 9.25", white $28.53

$114.12

4000/case
Trash can liner, 33 gal., 33x39, low density $38.95

$155.80

poly, 1.75 mil, 200 bag/case
#5751063
Trash Liner 55 gallon black high-density $24.92

$99.68

200/cs
#5750571
Toilet tissue, rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheet/roll, 96 $61.61

$123.22

rolls/case
#2453540
Dawn, Joy, Palmolive dish detergent, 10-12 $38.53

$77.06

oz., assorted
#4450519
Paper hot cup 8oz., single poly, white $59.05

$5690.50

20/50 1000/case
#1254538

Plastic Container, 50z. Cup size, 1,000/cs $169.64

$9,578.40

#8131205
Lids for 50z. Plastic Container 1,000/cs $147.06

$8,823.60

#8131207
Clorox disinfectant, 6 gallons/case $18.57
#4750523
Paper towels, roll, double ply $49.35

$37.14

$197.40

#2551530
Tea bags, 100/box, 10 boxes/case $16.34
#8123188
Sugar, individual packets, 3000/cs $17.96

$32.68

$179.60

#1203505
Plastic Spoons, Med. Weight, 1000/cs, $18.24

$182.40

100/pkg.
#1354050
Plastic Knives, med-heavy weight, 100/pk., $17.21

$172.10

10 per case
#1352550
Chopsticks, individual paper wrapped $66.25

$132.50

#1350510

Press and seal wrap, dispenser type box ~ NO BID

3-compartment food tray hinged w/lid $57.99

$1,159.80

compostable bagasse with plastic coating

#2653582

Cream - Individual serving packet $18.90
#1202505

TOTAL LUMP SUM BID FOR ITEMS 1 THRU 286

$37.80

$23,995.41




1 10 CASE

2 5 CASE

3 2 CASE

4 4 CASE

5 2 CASE

6 2 CASE

7 2 CASE

8 2 CASE

9 2 CASE

10 4 CASE

11 2 CASE

12 2 CASE

13 5 CASE

14 10 CASE

15 10 CASE

16 2 CASE

3 é/on%bar\t‘ment tray hinge“\/vllia,

polypropylene, earthchoice H/T White,
200/cs, medium or similar

#2653592

Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface
6/95 pop-up container

#8143814

Chopsticks, individual paper wrapped
#1350510

Plastic fork, med.-heavy weight, 100/pack,
10 packs/case

#1351050

Plastic spoon, 5" 1000/case, LS-1, Winkler
#947-005

#1354050

Dispenser napkins, 8" x 12-1/2",
10000/case, SCOTT 98710

#2054026

Aluminum foil, pop-up sheet, 12" x 10-3/4",
500 sheets/box, 6 boxes/case, 721
REYNOLDS

#0103539

OEG-100 disposable gloves, large,
1000/case, 10 boxes/case GAUN prefer
pop-ups - no rolls

#4650538

Muiti-fold paper towel, 9.4" x 9.25", white,
4000/case

#2552015

Paper hot cup 8oz., single poly, white
20/50 1000/case

#1254538

Toilet tissue: Kimberly Clark SS #0446,

rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheet/roll, 96/case, 45ibs.,
4-1/2 x 4-1/2

#2453540

Trash Liner 55 gallon black high-density
200/cs

#5750571

Tea bags, 100/box - 10/box - 10
boxes/case

#8123188

Tray 5-compartment, luau style, 10.5x8.5"
compostable bagasse w/plastic/wax lining,
4/125/cs

#2656005

3-compartment food tray hinge w/lid
compostable bagasse with plastic/wax
lining

#2653582

Trash Liner, low-density 33x39 MB 33
#5750566

$47.08 $470.80
$37.97  $189.85
$66.25 $132.50
$18.07 $180.70
$18.24 $182.40
$3672  $73.44
$102.78 $205.56
$1616  $3232
$2853  $57.06
$59.05 $236.20
$61.61 $123.22
$2648  $52.96
$1634  $81.70
$100.23 $1,002.30
$57.99 $579.90
$2285  $45.70




17 2 CASE Clorox disinfectant, 6 gallons/case $18.57 $37.14
#4750523

Plastic container, 5 oz. cup, FK5CC, $159.64 $319.28
1000/case - -

#8131205
19 2CASE  Pilastic lid, for 5 oz. cup, L5CC, 1000/case $147.06 $294.12

#8131207
20 2 CASE  Sugar - individual packet, 2000/case $17.96 $36.92
#1203505

Press and seal wrap, dispenser type, NO BID
10/140 sq. ft./case o

18 2 CASE

21 2 CASE

Dawn, Joy, Palmolive dish detergent 10-12 $38.56 $77.12

22 2 CASE 0z., assorted

#450519

Tentative IoW bidder - In Bold

Bid Summaries emailed to:
Managing Director
Director of Finance
Corporation Counsel
Council Chariman

Opened by: Greg King [/%’(\ TN

Witnessed by: Jared Masud

(A~

]
Greg King, Central Purchasing Agent




