

BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M., February 4, 2021

JOB TITLE:

Furnishing & Delivery of Traffic Signs & Markings Materials for The Department of Public Works Highways Division

Jan 1, 2021 - June 30, 2022

JOB NO.

IFB 20-21/P-31

VENDOR:

3M Company

GP Roadway

Safety Systems

ITEM #	EST. QTY.	DESCRIPTION	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
A1	20 _{pcs}	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 6"H x 10" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$4.71	\$1.16
A2	30 _{pcs}	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 6"H x 12" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$2.01	\$1.40
A3	15 _{pcs}	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 6"H x 18" x .063 NO HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$2.53	\$2.10
A4	15 _{pcs}	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 6"H x 24" x .063 NO HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$3.06	\$3.27
A5	15 _{pcs}	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 6"H x 30" x .063 NO HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$3.56	\$4.08
A6	10 _{pcs}	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 6"H x 36" x .063 NO HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$3.83	\$4.88
A7	30 _{pcs}	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 8"H x 24" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$6.54	\$3.72

A8	10pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 8"H x 30" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$11.41	\$4.65
A9	10pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 9" x 9" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$7.38	\$1.57
A10	10pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 9"H x12" x .063 3/8"HOLES w/STANDARD	No Bid	\$2.51	\$2.10
A11	15pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 9"H x 18" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$3.24	\$3.18
A12	20pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 10"H x 18" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$7.19	\$3.47
A13	20pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANKS 10"H x 24" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$7.80	\$4.65
A14	10pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANKS 27"H x 10" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$19.11	\$5.22
A15	20pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 12" x 12" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$3.04	\$4.33
A16	300pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 18"H x 12" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$3.97	\$3.69

A17	75pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 24"H x 12" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$4.42	\$4.91
A18	10pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 30"H x 12" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$5.80	\$6.95
A19	100pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 36"H x 12" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$7.65	\$7.37
A20	10pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 48"H x 12" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$9.68	\$11.10
A21	200pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 18" x 18" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$5.25	\$5.52
A22	300pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 24"H x 18" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$7.02	\$7.36
A23	100pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 24" x 24" x .063 3/8 HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$8.91	\$9.99
A24	300pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 30"H x 24" x .080 3/8 HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$13.96	\$15.54
A25	25pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 36"H x 24" x .080 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$17.09	\$21.10

A26	25pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 48"H x 24" x .080 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$22.91	\$28.44
A27	300pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 30" x 30" x .080 (4) 3/8" HOLES (AS SHOWN) w/ STD CORNERS	No Bid	\$17.43	\$19.42
A28	20pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 36"H x 30" x .080 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$21.18	\$26.36
A29	12pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 48"H x 30" x .080 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$29.07	\$35.55
A30	50pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 36" x 36" x .080 (2) 3/8 HOLES (AS SHOWN) w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$26.24	\$31.66
A31	10pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 48"H x 36" x .080 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$33.89	\$42.42
A32	20pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 48" x 48" x .080 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$45.20	\$56.49
A33	10pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 18"H x 48" x .080 NO HOLES w/ SQUARE CORNERS	No Bid	\$17.11	\$21.07
A34	10pcs	0.100 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 18"H x 60" x .100 NO HOLES w/ SQUARE CORNERS	No Bid	\$37.20	\$32.45
A35	10pcs	0.100 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 18"H x 72" x .100 NO HOLES w/ SQUARE CORNERS	No Bid	\$42.71	\$39.36

A36	10pcs	0.100 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 18"H x 84" x .100 NO HOLES w/ SQUARE CORNERS	No Bid	\$48.27	\$45.42
A37	10pcs	0.100 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 18"H x 96" x .100 NO HOLES w/ SQUARE CORNERS	No Bid	\$54.46	\$51.94
A38	200pcs	0.063 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 24" OCTAGON (STOP) 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$8.30	\$9.00
A39	200pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 30" OCTAGON (STOP) 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$16.26	\$17.66
A40	200pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 36" OCTAGON (STOP) 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$23.69	\$25.65
A41	30pcs	0.080 ALUMINUM - SIGN BLANK 30" x 30" (SCHOOL) 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS	No Bid	\$17.62	\$20.85
A42					
A43	100pcs	REFLECTORS - YELLOW 3" x 3" x .063 3/8" SINGLE HOLE w/ STD CORNERS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$3.00	\$1.89
A44	100pcs	REFLECTORS - WHITE 3" x 3" x .063 3/8" SINGLE HOLES w/ STD CORNERS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$3.00	\$1.89
A45	300pcs	REFLECTORS - YELLOW 3" x 12" x .063 3/8" HOLES w/ STANDARD CORNERS HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$3.50	\$3.06

A46	100 _{ea}	TRAFFIC CONES - FLUORESCENT ORANGE 18" NO STRIPE w/WORDING: ONE SIDED "C OF M - TS&M"	No Bid	\$8.60	\$8.56
A47	100 _{ea}	TRAFFIC CONES - FLUORESCENT ORANGE 18" w/ 6" REFLECTIVE COLLARS w/WORDING: ONE SIDED "C OF M - TS&M"	No Bid	\$11.55	\$11.78
A48	100 _{ea}	TRAFFIC CONES - FLUORESCENT ORANGE 28" NO STRIPE w/WORDING: ONE SIDED "C OF M - TS&M"	No Bid	\$14.80	\$13.10
A49	100 _{ea}	TRAFFIC CONES - FLUORESCENT ORANGE 28" w/ 6" & 4" REFLECTIVE COLLARS w/WORDING: ONE SIDED "C OF M - TS&M"	No Bid	\$18.82	\$18.99
A50					
A51	100 _{pcs}	SIGN BRACKET 90 DEG. TO POST FLANGE BRACKET FOR U-CHANNEL POST	No Bid	\$4.84	\$3.88
A52	100 _{pcs}	SIGN BRACKET 180 DEG. TO POST FLANGE BRACKET FOR U-CHANNEL POST	No Bid	\$4.84	\$4.03
A53	200 _{pcs}	SIGN BRACKET CROSS SIGN TO SIGN	No Bid	\$5.03	\$5.29
A54	100 _{pcs}	SIGN BRACKET POST CAP 5" SLOT FOR 2" SQUARE POST	No Bid	\$5.35	\$5.65

A55	20pcs	OVERHEAD MAST ARM ADJUSTABLE LENGTH w/ SPRING BRACKET	No Bid	\$80.00	\$82.86
A56	20pcs	OVERHEAD MAST ARM FIXED LENGTH w/ SPRING BRACKET	No Bid	\$57.00	\$59.05
A57	200pcs	SQUARE TUBING 2" x 2" x 9' 12 GAUGE	No Bid	\$37.82	\$37.86
A58	300pcs	SQUARE TUBING 2" x 2" x 10' 12 GAUGE	No Bid	\$37.82	\$42.07
A59	300pcs	SQUARE TUBING 2" x 2" x 11' 12 GAUGE	No Bid	\$41.60	\$46.28
A60	40pcs	SQUARE TUBING 2" x 2" x 12' 12 GAUGE	No Bid	\$45.97	\$50.48
A61	60pcs	SQUARE TUBING 2" x 2" x 16' 12 GAUGE	No Bid	\$99.93	\$67.32
A62	500pcs	ANCHOR POST 2 1/4" x 2 1/4" x 3' 12 GAUGE	No Bid	\$14.04	\$15.84
A63	50ea	SURFACE MOUNT BREAKAWAY FOR 2" x 2" SQUARE POST w/ INSTALLATION HARDWARE	No Bid	\$70.74	\$139.35
A64	100 ea	BREAKAWAY SIGN POST COUPLER FOR SQUARE TUBING, 12 GAUGE, 2- 0/0"	No Bid	No Bid	\$71.27
A65	200pcs	U-CHANNEL POST 2" x 6' 1.12LBS	No Bid	\$10.54	\$9.64
A66					
A67	10bxs	SHEETING 24" x 50yds. TYPE IV ORANGE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$259.37	\$388.05	\$386.03
A68	10bxs	SHEETING 24" x 50yds. TYPE XI FLUORESCENT YEL/GRN HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$546.87	\$739.14	\$735.30
A69	10bxs	SHEETING 24" x 50yds. TYPE IV RED HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$259.37	\$388.05	\$386.03

A70	10bxs	SHEETING 24" x 50yds. TYPE IV YELLOW HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$259.37	\$388.05	\$386.03
A71	20bxs	SHEETING 24" x 50yds. TYPE IV WHITE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$259.37	\$388.05	\$386.03
A72	5bxs	SHEETING 24" x 50yds. TYPE IV GREEN HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$259.37	\$739.14	\$386.03
A73	10bxs	SHEETING 24" x 50yds. TYPE IV BLUE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$259.37	\$388.05	\$386.03
A74	10bxs	SHEETING 30" x 50 yds. TYPE IV RED HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$324.22	\$485.06	\$482.54
A75	10bxs	SHEETING 30" x 50 yds. TYPE IV BLUE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$324.22	\$485.06	\$482.54
A76	10bxs	SHEETING 30" x 50yds. TYPE IV RED HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$324.22	\$485.06	\$482.54
A77	5bxs	SHEETING 30" x 50yds. TYPE IV GREEN HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$324.22	\$923.93	\$482.54
A78	10bxs	SHEETING 30" x 50yds. TYPE XI FLUORESCENT YEL/GRN HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$683.59	\$485.06	\$919.12
A79	5bxs	SHEETING 30" x 50yds. TYPE IV ORANGE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$324.22	\$485.06	\$482.54
A80	20bxs	SHEETING 30" x 50yds. TYPE IV YELLOW HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$324.22	\$485.06	\$482.54
A81	10bxs	SHEETING 30" x 50yds. TYPE IV WHITE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$324.22	\$485.06	\$482.54

A82	5bxs	SHEETING 36" x 50yds. TYPE XI FLOURESCENT YEL/GRN HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$820.31	\$1,108.72	\$1,102.94
A83	10bxs	SHEETING 36" x 50yds. TYPE IV WHITE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$389.06	\$582.08	\$579.05
A84	10bxs	SHEETING 36" x 50 yds. TYPE IV YELLOW HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$389.06	\$582.08	\$579.05
A85	10bxs	SHEETING 36" x 50yds. TYPE IV BLUE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$389.06	\$582.08	\$579.05
A86	10bxs	SHEETING 36" x 50yds. TYPE IV GREEN HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$389.06	\$582.08	\$579.05
A87	10bxs	SHEETING 36" x 50yds. TYPE IV RED HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$389.06	\$582.08	\$579.05
A88	10bxs	SHEETING 36" x 50yds. TYPE IV ORANGE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$389.06	\$582.08	\$579.05
A89	10bxs	SHEETING 48" x 50yds. TYPE IV WHITE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$518.75	\$776.10	\$772.06
A90	10bxs	SHEETING 48" x 50yds. TYPE IV YELLOW HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$518.75	\$776.10	\$772.06
A91	10bxs	SHEETING 48" x 50yds. TYPE IV BLUE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$518.75	\$776.10	\$772.06
A92	10bxs	SHEETING 48" x 50yds. TYPE IV GREEN HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$518.75	\$776.10	\$772.06
A93	10bxs	SHEETING 48" x 50yds. TYPE IV RED HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$518.75	\$776.10	\$772.06

A94	10bxs	SHEETING 48" x 50yds. TYPE IV ORANGE HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$518.75	\$776.10	\$772.06
A95	10bxs	SHEETING 48" x 50yds. TYPE IV FLUORESCENT YEL/GRN HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	\$1,093.74	\$776.10	\$1,420.45
A96	20rolls	APPLICATION TAPE (TRANSFER TAPE) PAPER TYPE 4" x 100yds.	No Bid	\$18.77	\$23.27
A97	20rolls	APPLICATION TAPE (TRANSFER TAPE) PAPER TYPE 6" x 100yds	No Bid	\$28.17	\$34.04
A98	10rolls	APPLICATION TAPE (TRANSFER TAPE) PAPER TYPE 12" x 100yds	No Bid	\$51.31	\$62.87
A99	10rolls	APPLICATION TAPE (TRANSFER TAPE) PLASTIC TYPE 4" x 100yds	\$31.25	\$18.77	\$23.27
A100	10rolls	APPLICATION TAPE (TRANSFER TAPE) PLASTIC TYPE 6" x 100yds	\$46.87	\$28.17	\$35.77
A101	10rolls	APPLICATION TAPE (TRANSFER TAPE) PLASTIC TYPE 12" x 100yds	\$93.75	\$72.85	\$64.60
A102	10bxs	GREEN SHEETING (DARK GREEN) ENGINEER GRADE 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$196.34	\$199.79
A103	10bxs	RED SHEETING (CARDINAL RED) ENGINEER GRADE 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$196.34	\$199.79

A104	10bxs	WHITE SHEETING ENGINEER GRADE 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$196.34	\$199.79
A105	5bxs	BLUE SHEETING ENGINEER GRADE 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$196.34	\$199.79
A106	5bxs	ORANGE SHEETING ENGINEER GRADE 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$196.34	\$199.79
A107	5bxs	YELLOW SHEETING ENGINEER GRADE 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$196.34	\$199.79
A108	150pcs	GREEN SHEETING 9" x 24" STREET SIGN ENGINEER GRADE	No Bid	\$15.03	\$20.83
A109	100pcs	GREEN SHEETING 9" x 30" STREET SIGN ENGINEER GRADE	No Bid	\$17.79	\$25.24
A110	100pcs	GREEN SHEETING 9" x 36" STREET SIGN ENGINEER GRADE	No Bid	\$22.55	\$31.71
A111	30bxs	BLACK VINYL (GLOSS) 15" x 50yds. PUNCHED	No Bid	\$256.39	\$255.06
A112	5bxs	WHITE VINYL (GLOSS) 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$256.39	\$255.06
A113	5bxs	RED VINYL (GLOSS)(CARDINAL RED) 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$256.39	\$255.06
A114	5bxs	BLUE VINYL (GLOSS) 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$256.39	\$255.06
A115	5bxs	ORANGE VINYL (GLOSS) 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$256.39	\$255.06
A116	5bxs	YELLOW VINYL (GLOSS) 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$256.39	\$255.06
A117	5bxs	GREEN VINYL (GLOSS)(DARK GREEN) 15" x 50yds PUNCHED	No Bid	\$256.39	\$255.06

A118					
A119	10ea	BARRICADES - TYPE II w/O LIGHT PLASTIC CONTRUCTION 12" TOP PANEL HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$56.06	\$63.69
A120	10pcs	BARRICADE SOLAR LIGHT D-BOLT - TYPE A/C (2 SIDED VISIBILITY)	No Bid	\$28.35	\$34.23
A121					
A122	200pcs	FLEXSTAKE 48" WHITE SURFACE MOUNT w/2 SIDED REFLECTIVE SHEETING POST ONLY	No Bid	\$28.82	\$18.63
A123	20pcs	IN STREET PED XING CROSSING SIGN, DOUBLE SIDE, QR "STATE LAW STOP TO PEDESTRIANS"	No Bid	\$271.27	\$316.20
A124	20pcs	QR, SPRING TYPE SURFACE MOUNT BASE w/ MULTI SURFACE ANCHOR KIT	No Bid	\$21.77	\$18.27
A125	50pcs	3" TUFF POST (3" OD) SHORT SQUEEZE, YELLOW (48") QR SPRING TYPE	No Bid	\$73.78	\$89.64
A126	50pcs	3" TUFF POST (3" OD) SHORT SQUEEZE, WHITE (28") QR SPRING TYPE	No Bid	\$69.24	\$89.64
A127	10ea	4" TUFF POST (4' OD) LONG SQUEEZE, YELLOW (36), QR SPRING TYPE w/HIGH INTENSITY SHEETING	No Bid	\$85.13	\$108.87
A128	10ea	TUFF CURB XLP, YELLOW, 40" x 8" x 2", QR w/TWO GLASS ELEMENT REFLECTORS & HARDWARE TO INSTALL	No Bid	\$83.99	\$102.36

A129	10ea	TUFF CURB, YELLOW 40" x 12" x 3.5", QR w/ TWO GLASS ELEMENT REFLECTORS & HARDWARE TO INSTALL	No Bid	\$141.88	\$168.76
A130	10ea	TUFF CURB XLP, WHITE 40" x 8" x 2", QR w/ TWO GLASS ELEMENT REFLECTORS (WHITE/RED COMBINATION), HARDWARE TO INSTALL	No Bid	\$83.99	\$102.36
A131	10ea	QR BLUE SPRING ASSEMBLY, REPLACEMENT	No Bid	\$42.37	\$45.97
A132					
A133	50pcs	DECAL ONLY - CHEVRON (MUTCD W1- 8) 30"H x 24" HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$18.55	\$15.18
A134	150pcs	DECAL ONLY - CHEVRON (MUTCD W1- 8) 24"H x 18" HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$11.13	\$11.23
A135	150pcs	DECAL ONLY - OBJECT MARKER RIGHT (MUTCD OM-3R) 36"H x 12" HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$11.13	\$11.27
A136	150pcs	DECAL ONLY - OBJECT MARKER LEFT (MUTCD OM-3L) 36"H x 12" HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$11.13	\$11.27
A137	100pcs	DECAL ONLY - ONE WAY (LEFT ARROW) (MUTCD R6-1L) 12"H x 36" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$11.13	\$11.27

A138	100pcs	DECAL ONLY - ONE WAY (RIGHT ARROW) (MUTCD R6-1R) 12"H x 36" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$11.13	\$11.27
A139	200ea	DECAL ONLY 24" STOP SIGN (MUTCD R1-1) HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$14.84	\$10.41
A140	200ea	DECAL ONLY 30" STOP SIGN (MUTCD R1-1) HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$23.19	\$19.33
A141	20 ea	DECAL ONLY 36" STOP SIGN (MUTCD R1-1) HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$33.39	\$28.21
A142	50ea	DECAL ONLY "STOP AHEAD" (30"x30") (MUTCD W3-1) HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$30.00	\$23.75
A143	20ea	DECAL ONLY "STOP AHEAD" (36" x 36") (MUTCD W3-1) HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$43.19	\$31.11
A144	50ea	DECAL ONLY "YIELD AHEAD" (30"x 30") (MUTCH W3-2) HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC	No Bid	\$30.00	\$23.75
A145					
A146	100pcs	ONE WAY (LEFT ARROW) (MUTCD R6-1L) 12"H x 36" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$19.45	\$16.85

A147	100pcs	ONE WAY (RIGHT ARROW) (MUTCD R6-1R) 12"H x 36" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$19.45	\$16.85
A148	50pcs	ONE WAY (LEFT ARROW) (MUTCD R6-1L) -DOUBLE SIDED- 12"H x 36" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$41.96	\$26.02
A149	50pcs	ONE WAY (RIGHT ARROW) (MUTCD R6-1R) -DOUBLE SIDED- 12"H x 36" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$41.96	\$26.02
A150	100pcs	24" STOP SIGN (MUTCD R1-1) HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.063 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$27.91	\$19.31
A151	100pcs	30" STOP SIGN (MUTCD R1-1) HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$38.97	\$32.66
A152	100pcs	36" STOP SIGN (MUTCD R1-1) HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$59.64	\$47.08
A153	100pcs	Speed Limit 15 MPH (MUTCD R2-1) 24"H x 30" HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$35.83	\$26.66

A154	100pcs	Speed Limit 20 MPH (MUTCD R2-1) 24"H x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$35.83	\$27.28
A155	100pcs	Speed Limit 25 MPH (MUTCD R2-1) 24"H x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$33.80	\$26.66
A156	100pcs	Speed Limit 30 MPH (MUTCD R2-1) 24"H x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$34.63	\$26.66
A157	100pcs	"STOP AHEAD" (MUTCD W3-1) 36" x 36" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$87.88	\$47.34
A158	100pcs	"SPEED BUMP" SIGN (MUTCD W8-15B) 30" x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC YELLOW 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$43.75	\$33.37
A159	100pcs	"SPEED BUMPS" SIGN (MUTCD W8-15B) 30" x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC YELLOW 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$43.75	\$33.37

A160	100pcs	"SPEED TABLE" SIGN (MUTCD W17-1) 30" x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC YELLOW 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$54.02	\$33.37
A161	100pcs	PEDESTRIAN CROSSING SIGN (MUTCD W11-2) 30" x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC YELLOW 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$64.18	\$33.61
A162	100pcs	PEDESTRIAN CROSSING SIGN (MUTCD W11-2) 36" x 36" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC YELLOW 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$87.19	\$47.70
A163	100pcs	PEDESTRIAN CROSSING SIGN (MUTCD W11-2) 30" x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC FLUORESCENT YELLOW/GREEN 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$64.18	\$45.21
A164	100pcs	PEDESTRIAN CROSSING SIGN (MUTCD W11-2) 36" x 36" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC FLUORESCENT YELLOW/GREEN 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$87.19	\$64.73

A165	100pcs	SCHOOL "AHEAD" SIGN (MUTCD W16-9P) 8"H x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC FLUORESCENT YELLOW/GREEN 0.063 ALUM, w/ STD CORNERS, w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$15.12	\$15.79
A166	100pcs	SCHOOL CROSSING SIGN (MUTCD S1-1) 30" x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC YELLOW 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$53.91	\$46.52
A167	100pcs	SCHOOL CROSSING SIGN (MUTCD S1-1) 30" x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC FLUORESCENT YELLOW/GREEN 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$63.20	\$32.82
A168	100pcs	"SCHOOL" SIGN (MUTCD S4-3P) 8"H x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC YELLOW 0.063 ALUM, w/ STD CORNERS, w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$13.05	\$8.33
A169	100pcs	Down Diagonal Left Arrow (MUTCD W16-7PL) 12"H x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC YELLOW 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$20.19	\$11.74

A170	100pcs	Down Diagonal Left Arrow (MUTCD W16-7PL) 12"H x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC FLUORESCENT YELLOW/GREEN 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$20.19	\$15.50
A171	100pcs	Down Diagonal RIGHT Arrow (MUTCD W16-7PR) 12"H x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC YELLOW 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$20.19	\$11.74
A172	100pcs	Down Diagonal RIGHT Arrow (MUTCD W16-7PR) 12"H x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC FLUORESCENT YELLOW/GREEN 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$20.19	\$15.50
A173	100pcs	CHEVRON SYMBOL SIGN (MUTCD W1-8) 24"H x 18" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$19.51	\$16.35
A174	100pcs	CHEVRON SYMBOL SIGN (MUTCD W1-8) 30"H x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$19.51	\$26.64

A175	100pcs	DEAD END SIGN (MUTCD W14-1) 24" x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$43.75	\$22.28
A176	100pcs	WEIGHT LIMIT (MUTCD W12-1) (WEIGHT # BLANK) 30"H x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$34.63	\$27.36
A177	100pcs	OBJECT MARKER LEFT (MUTCD OM- 3L) 36"H x 12" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$19.64	\$16.91
A178	100pcs	OBJECT MARKER RIGHT (MUTCD OM- 3R) 36"H x 12" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$19.64	\$16.91
A179	100pcs	"NO PARKING ANYTIME" (MUTCD R-40) W/O ARROW 18"H x 12" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.063 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$12.82	\$8.46
A180	100pcs	"NO PARKING HERE TO CORNER" (MUTCD R-40L) (LEFT ARROW) 18"H x 12" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.063 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$12.82	\$8.46

A181	100pcs	"NO PARKING HERE TO CORNER" (MUTCD R-40R) (RIGHT ARROW) 18"H x 12" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.063 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$12.82	\$8.46
A182	100pcs	"NO PARKING ANYTIME" (MUTCD R7- 1L) (LEFT ARROW) 18"H x 12" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.063 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$12.38	\$8.46
A183	100pcs	"NO PARKING ANYTIME" (MUTCD R7- 1R) (RIGHT ARROW) 18"H x 12" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.063 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$12.38	\$8.46
A184	100pcs	"NO PARKING ANYTIME" (MUTCD R7- 1D) (DOUBLE ARROW) 18"H x 12" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.063 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$12.38	\$8.46
A185	100pcs	"YIELD" SIGN (MUTCD W1-2) 30" x 30" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.080 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$43.75	\$19.73
A186	100pcs	"YIELD" SIGN (MUTCD W1-2) 24" x 24" - HIGH INTENSITY PRISMATIC 0.063 ALUM w/ STD CORNERS w/ 3/8" HOLES	No Bid	\$43.75	\$13.12

B PREFORM THERMO (MUTCD COMPLIANT, 0.125 MIL WITH REFLECTIVE GLASS BEADS)					
B1	10bxs	RIGHT TURN ARROW, STANDARD 8' x 6'1" WHITE	No Bid	\$260.95	\$273.70
B2	25bxs	LEFT TURN ARROW, STANDARD 8' x 6'1" WHITE	No Bid	\$260.95	\$273.70
B3	25bxs	STRAIGHT ARROW, WHITE 9'10" (2 PACK)	No Bid	\$243.03	\$236.20
B4	4 bxs	"SHARRO w/ SHARED LANE" PREFORM THERMOPLASTIC SYMBOL 0.125 MIL (9'4" x 3'4") WHITE BOX OF (2)	No Bid	\$317.19	\$321.87
B5	25bxs	"COMBINATION" STRAIGHT / TURN ARROWS (LEFT AND RIGHT)	No Bid	\$298.27	\$321.87
B6	200/pk	12" x 3' WHITE LINE (10 PACK) .125 MIL WITH GLASS BEADS	No Bid	\$134.43	\$137.71
B7	100/pk	4" x 3' YELLOW LINE (30 PACK) .125 MIL WITH GLASS BEADS	No Bid	\$134.01	\$146.97
B8	200/pk	4" x 3' WHITE LINE (30 PACK) .125 MIL WITH GLASS BEADS	No Bid	\$134.01	\$137.71
B9	10/pk	4"x3' BLUE LINE (30 PACK) .125 MIL WITH GLASS BEADS	No Bid	\$143.76	\$152.05
B10	50bxs	"SCHOOL" LEGEND 8' WITH GLASS BEADS .125 MIL	No Bid	\$312.97	\$321.57
B11	50bxs	"STOP" LEGEND 8' WITH GLASS BEADS .125 MIL	No Bid	\$188.89	\$207.77
B12	50bxs	"STOP" LEGEND 4' WITH GLASS BEADS .125 MIL	No Bid	\$71.76	\$181.40
B13	10bxs	"AHEAD" LEGEND 8' WITH GLASS BEADS .125 MIL	No Bid	\$273.43	\$287.65
B14	50bxs	"BUMP" LEGEND 8' WITH GLASS BEADS .125 MIL	No Bid	\$204.07	\$214.25
B15	50bxs	"ONLY" LEGEND 8' WITH GLASS BEADS .125 MIL	No Bid	\$201.68	\$209.45

B16	10pk	HANDICAP WHITE ON BLUE 48"x48" (2 PACK)	No Bid	\$267.28	\$275.07
B17	25pk	SHARK TEETH YIELD MARKINGS (12"x18") WHITE 0.125 MIL WITH GLASS BEADS	No Bid	\$227.24	\$235.06
B18	300/pk	4" x 3' BLACK LINE (30 PACK)	No Bid	\$132.11	\$95.35
B19	300/pk	6" x 3' BLACK LINE (20 PACK)	No Bid	\$132.25	\$143.67
B20	10bxs	TEMP. TAPE 4" WHITE 300' / ROLL 600' / PER BOX OF 2	No Bid	\$147.41	\$167.12
B21	5bxs	TEMP. TAPE 4" YELLOW 300' / ROLL 600' / PER BOX OF 2	No Bid	\$147.41	\$167.12

C RAISE PAVEMENT MARKERS (RPM): INJECTION MOLDED SHELL w/					
--	--	--	--	--	--

C1	10,000pcs	2-WAY RED/WHITE 4" x 4" x 3/4"	No Bid	\$1.00	\$1.08
C2	10,000pcs	2-WAY YELLOW/YELLOW 4" x 4" x 3/4"	No Bid	\$1.00	\$1.08
C3	1,000pcs	2-WAY BLUE/BLUE 4" x4" x 3/4"	No Bid	\$1.15	\$1.14
C4	5,000pcs	1-WAY YELLOW 4" x 4" x 3/4"	No Bid	\$1.00	\$1.08
C5	1000ea	CERAMIC DOME BUTTONS MARKERS TYPE "J" YELLOW	No Bid	\$0.89	\$1.09
C6	1000ea	CERAMIC DOME BUTTONS MARKERS TYPE "A" WHITE	No Bid	\$0.99	\$1.06
C7	10bxs	TEMP FLEX MARKERS YELLOW 500/CASE	No Bid	\$255.24	\$295.28
C8	10bxs	TEMP FLEX MARKERS WHITE 500/CASE	No Bid	\$242.15	\$295.28

D SPRAY PAINT - LAYOUT					
D1	200 _{ea}	PINK (12 OZ. CAN) LEVEL 1 MARKING PAINT	No Bid	\$2.96	\$3.46
D2	100 _{ea}	WHITE (12 OZ. CAN) LEVEL 1 MARKING PAINT	No Bid	\$2.99	\$3.46
D3	100 _{ea}	YELLOW (12 OZ. CAN) LEVEL 1 MARKING PAINT	No Bid	\$2.99	\$3.46
D4	200 _{ea}	WHITE (18 OZ. CAN) LEVEL II STRIPING PAINT	No Bid	\$4.70	\$4.80
D5	100 _{ea}	YELLOW (18 OZ. CAN) LEVEL II STRIPING PAINT	No Bid	\$4.70	\$4.80
D6	100 _{ea}	BLACK (18 OZ. CAN) LEVEL II STRIPING PAINT	No Bid	\$4.61	\$4.80
E BITUMINOUS MARKER ADHESIVE					
E1	50 _{pcs}	5" x 5" PADS FOR RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS	No Bid	\$1.10	\$1.24
E2	100 _{bxs}	BITUMINOUS BLOCKS FOR MELTING (35 LB BOX)	No Bid	\$36.14	\$33.86
E3	5 _{bxs}	8' x 8" SUPER BUNDY PADS EPOXY PADS (80/BOX)	No Bid	\$190.61	\$172.95
E4	10 _{cans}	EPOXY RESIN ADHESIVES PART A & B GAL.	No Bid	\$127.06	\$132.78
F LIQUID THERMOPLASTIC (FAST DRY TRAFFIC PAINT - 5 GALLON)					
F1	216 _{pales}	WHITE	No Bid	\$84.27	\$99.71
F2	216 _{pales}	YELLOW	No Bid	\$85.38	\$97.28
G HOT THERMOPLASTIC					
G1	1000 _{bags}	ALKYD THERMOPLASTIC (HOT) YELLOW (50 POUND BAGS)	No Bid	\$47.28	\$52.57
G2	1000 _{bags}	ALKYD THERMOPLASTIC (HOT) WHITE (50 POUND BAGS)	No Bid	\$49.29	\$54.53
G3	100 _{bags}	TYPE I REFLECTIVE GLASS BEADS 50 POUND BAGS	No Bid	\$28.30	\$36.95

Tentative low bidder - In Bold
Bid Summaries emailed to:
Managing Director
Director of Finance
Corporation Counsel
Council Chairman
Director of Public Works
Risk Management
Budget Director

Opened by: Kevin Jiles, Purchasing Specialist

Witnessed by: Jared Masuda, Central Purchasing Agent