

BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M., April 13, 2021

JOB TITLE:

Furnishing & Delivery of Various Chemicals & Fertilizers Used at County Parks, Department of Parks & Recreation
Waiehu Municipal Golf Course Section

JOB NO.

IFB 20-21/P-120

VENDOR			
Nutrien	Phoenix V, LLC	Simplot	
\$5,909.96	\$7,541.12	\$5,909.76	BID ITEM A
\$10,458.26	NO BID	\$10,458.00	BID ITEM B
\$3,708.30	NO BID	\$3,600.00	BID ITEM C
\$140.62	\$92.58	\$134.40	BID ITEM D
\$7,203.70	NO BID	\$7,203.68	BID ITEM E
\$5,708.30	NO BID	\$5,708.30	BID ITEM F
\$888.74	NO BID	\$907.44	BID ITEM G
\$41,566.00	NO BID	\$40,929.00	BID ITEM H
\$3,146.97	NO BID	\$3,087.12	BID ITEM I
NO BID	\$14,312.79	\$14,901.39	BID ITEM J
\$3,599.98	NO BID	\$3,561.60	BID ITEM K
\$3,774.98	NO BID	\$3,861.60	BID ITEM L
\$10,899.93	NO BID	\$11,664.09	BID ITEM M

\$3,541.64	NO BID	\$3,733.00	BID ITEM N
\$5,312.46	NO BID	\$5,312.46	BID ITEM O
\$6,562.46	\$525.58	\$3,281.24	BID ITEM P
\$794.99	NO BID	\$795.00	BID ITEM Q
\$8,595.78	NO BID	\$8,595.84	BID ITEM R
\$8,265.57	NO BID	NO BID	BID ITEM S
\$4,199.97	NO BID	\$4,200.00	BID ITEM T
\$1,296.86	NO BID	\$1,296.84	BID ITEM U
\$560.41	NO BID	\$560.42	BID ITEM V
\$3,989.56	NO BID	\$1,994.80	BID ITEM W
\$6,562.45	NO BID	\$6,562.44	BID ITEM X
\$507.65	NO BID	\$507.63	BID ITEM Y
\$2,924.98	NO BID	\$2,924.94	BID ITEM Z
\$3,121.86	NO BID	\$3,121.92	BID ITEM AA
\$4,106.22	NO BID	\$4,106.25	BID ITEM BB
\$2,749.98	NO BID	\$2,750.04	BID ITEM CC
\$3,541.64	NO BID	\$3,541.64	BID ITEM DD
\$1,981.02	NO BID	\$1,981.00	BID ITEM EE

Tentative low bidder - **In Bold**

Bid Summaries emailed to:
 Managing Director
 Director of Finance
 Corporation Counsel
 Council Chairman
 Risk Management
 Budget Director

Bid Documents To:
 Todd Allen, Robert Agapay
 Department of Parks & Recreation

Opened by: Kevin Jiles, Purchasing Specialist
 Witnessed by: Jared Masuda, Central Purchasing Agent