

BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M., July 30, 2021

JOB TITLE:

Furnishing & Delivery of Expendable Foodservice Products for Senior Services

JOB NO.

IFB 21-22/P-20

KAUNOA (MAUI)

Quantity	Description	Maui Chemical & Paper		Triple F	
		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
25 case	3-compartment tray hinge w/lid, polypropylene, 8x8x3", white, must be White Premier Essential MFPP, 200/cs NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$65.27	\$1,631.75	\$61.09	\$1,527.18
20 case	9" 3-Compartment White Plate, Round, Bagasse Compostable, 4/125/case, WHBRG-9-3	\$79.36	\$1,587.20	\$41.47	\$829.40
12 case	Tray 5-compartment, luau style, 10.5x8.5", compostable bagasse with wax lining, 4/125/case	\$66.56	\$798.72	\$103.12	\$1,237.39
6 case	7 oz Ribbed Plastic Cup, Y7, 25/100/cs	\$77.75	\$466.50	\$81.68	\$490.07
6 case	8 oz Ripple Hot Paper Cup, C-KRC508, 25/100/cs, Kraft	\$59.57	\$357.42	\$59.50	\$357.01
36 case	Plastic Forks #3640, med/heavy weight, white, 6.5", 10/100/cs	\$14.47	\$520.92	\$24.01	\$864.40
36 case	Plastic Spoons #3642, med/heavy weight, white, 6.5", 10/100/cs KAR-U2003W	\$14.33	\$515.88	\$12.06	\$434.30
6 case	Plastic Knife, med/heavy weight, 100/pk, 10 pk/cs	\$13.12	\$78.72	\$18.15	\$108.89
2 case	Chopsticks, individual-wrapped, 3/4 wrap paper, 100 pairs/pk, 40 pk/cs	\$120.52	\$241.04	\$67.80	\$135.59
4 case	Tea Bags, black tea, 312/cs	\$16.64	\$66.56	\$26.83	\$107.33
4 case	Creamer - Individual Serving Packet, per case	\$18.90	\$75.60	\$19.49	\$77.95
4 case	Sugar, individual packets, 2000/case	\$18.36	\$73.44	\$16.25	\$65.00
1 case	Wood Coffee Stirrers 7.5", Round End, 10/500/cs	\$36.06	\$36.06	\$28.64	\$28.64
25 case	Dispenser Napkin, tall fold white, 13.5x7", 20/500/case, Karat	\$62.55	\$1,563.75	\$59.59	\$1,489.80
5 case	Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface, 6/95 pop-up container	\$54.03	\$270.15	\$52.35	\$261.76

<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Maui Chemical & Paper</u>		<u>Triple F</u>	
		<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
20 case	Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 wipes each canister, 12 canisters per case, No Substitutions	\$44.05	\$881.00	\$105.00	\$2,100.72
5 case	Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheet, 12"x10.75", 500 shts/box 6 boxes/case, prefer Reynolds KAR-FWAFS100	\$117.96	\$589.80	\$11.80	\$59.02
12 case	Disposable Gloves, OEG-1, large size, poly hybrid, 5/205/200/case, prefer pop-up, no rolls	\$31.20	\$374.40	\$23.74	\$284.86
10 case	Food Tray, 1/2#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie	\$28.48	\$284.80	\$26.82	\$268.19
4 case	Food Tray, 1#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie	\$36.10	\$144.40	\$39.59	\$158.34
30 case	5 oz Food Container, polystyrene, clear, 10/100/case, #FK-5CC, must be Fabri-Kal FK-5CC, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$221.62	\$6,648.60	\$143.51	\$4,305.21
30 case	Lids for 5oz. Plastic Container, clear, flat, 8/125/case, #L5CC, must be Fabri-Kal L5CC, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$202.98	\$6,089.40	\$124.22	\$3,726.45
2 case	Dish Soap, 20 oz/bottle, 6 bottles/case, Dawn/Joy/Palmolive	\$42.51	\$85.02	\$30.88	\$60.16
1 case	Clorox Bleach, 16oz (or 5 case 32 oz.) bottles	No Bid	No Bid	\$208.43	\$208.43
1 case	Plastic Sandwich Bag, Zip Lock top	\$32.42	\$32.42	\$21.97	\$21.97
1 case	Press & Seal Wrap, dispenser type box	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.97	\$21.97
1 case	5.5oz White Baking Cup, 500/bx, 20 bx/cs	\$109.11	\$109.11	\$65.85	\$65.85
6 case	Trash Liner, 33x40, high density, black liner, 19 micron, 250/cs	\$31.76	\$190.56	\$32.50	\$195.00
6 case	Trash Liner, 55 gallon black, high-density, 200/cs	\$37.13	\$222.78	\$31.95	\$191.72

LANA'I

<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Maui Chemical & Paper</u>		<u>Triple F</u>	
		<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
50 case	3-compartment tray hinge w/lid, polypropylene, 8x8x3", White must be White Premier Essential MFPP, 200/cs NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$65.28	\$3,264.00	\$58.27	\$2,913.38
2 case	Tray 5-compartment, luau style, 10.5x8.5", compostable bagasse with wax lining, 4/125/case	\$66.56	\$133.12	\$103.12	\$206.23
6 case	7 oz Ribbed Plastic Cup, Y7, 25/100/cs	\$77.75	\$466.50	\$81.68	\$490.07

<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Maui Chemical & Paper</u>		<u>Triple F</u>	
		<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
6 case	8 oz Karat Paper Hot Cup, White, 50/pk, 20pk/cs	\$56.19	\$337.14	\$59.50	\$357.01
12 case	Plastic Forks #3640, med/heavy weight, white, 6.5", 10/100/cs	\$14.47	\$173.64	\$24.01	\$288.13
12 case	Plastic Spoons #3642, med/heavy weight, white, 6.5", 10/100/cs	\$14.33	\$171.96	\$12.06	\$144.77
1 case	Plastic Knife, med/heavy weight, 100/pk, 10 pk/cs	\$13.12	\$13.12	\$18.15	\$18.15
1 case	Chopsticks, individual-wrapped, 3/4 wrap paper, 100 pairs/pk, 40 pk/cs	\$120.52	\$120.52	\$67.80	\$67.80
1 case	Tea Bags, black tea, 312/cs	\$16.64	\$16.64	\$26.83	\$26.83
1 case	Creamer - Individual Serving Packet, per case	\$18.90	\$18.90	\$19.49	\$19.49
1 case	Sugar, individual packets, 2000/case	\$18.36	\$18.36	\$16.25	\$16.25
1 case	Decaffeinated Instant Ground Coffee, 30.5 oz cannisters, 4/case, prefer Folgers or similar	\$18.25	\$18.25	\$130.00	\$130.00
12 case	Dispenser Napkin, tall fold white, 13.5x7", 20/500/case, Karat	\$62.55	\$750.60	\$59.59	\$715.10
6 case	Multi-Fold Paper Towel, White, 9.1 x 9.5", 4000/cs prefer Cascade Pro Select H124	\$35.15	\$210.90	\$24.56	\$147.34
6 case	Paper Towel Rolls, 2-ply, 30 rolls/case	\$45.54	\$273.24	\$35.97	\$215.83
6 case	Toilet Tissue Rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheets/roll, 96 rolls/case, 45lb	\$58.50	\$351.00	\$54.72	\$328.30
1 case	Facial Tissue, 2-ply, flat box, white, 48/125/case, prefer Kleenex	\$28.36	\$28.36	\$26.66	\$26.66
1 case	Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface, 6/95 pop-up container	\$54.03	\$54.03	\$52.35	\$52.35
5 case	Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 wipes each canister, 12 canisters per case. No Substitutions	\$44.05	\$220.25	\$105.00	\$525.00
1 case	Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheet, 12"x10.75", 500 shts/box 6 boxes/case, prefer Reynolds	\$117.96	\$117.96	\$11.80	\$11.80
6 case	Disposable Gloves, OEG-1, med size, poly hybrid, 5/200/case, prefer pop-up, no rolls	\$32.01	\$192.06	\$23.74	\$142.43

<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Maui Chemical & Paper</u>		<u>Triple F</u>	
		<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
4 case	Food Tray, 1/2#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie	\$28.48	\$113.92	\$26.82	\$107.28
1 case	Food Tray, 1#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie	\$36.10	\$36.10	\$39.59	\$39.59
1 case	5 oz Food Container, polystyrene, clear, 10/100/case, #FK-5CC, must be Fabri-Kal FK-5CC, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$221.62	\$221.62	\$143.51	\$143.51
1 case	Lids for 5oz. Plastic Container, clear, flat, 8/125/case, #L5CC, must be Fabri-Kal L5CC, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$202.98	\$202.98	\$124.22	\$124.22
2 case	Dish Soap, 20 oz/bottle, 6 bottles/case, Dawn/Joy/Palmolive	\$42.51	\$85.02	\$30.08	\$60.16
1 case	Clorox Bleach, 16oz (or 5 case 32 oz.) bottles	No Bid	No Bid	\$208.43	\$208.43
1 case	Plastic Sandwich Bag, Zip Lock top	\$32.42	\$32.42	\$21.97	\$21.97
1 case	Press & Seal Wrap, dispenser type box	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.97	\$21.97
6 case	Trash Liner, 33x40, high density, black liner, 19 micron, 250/cs	\$31.76	\$190.56	\$32.50	\$195.00
6 case	Trash Liner, 55 gallon black, high-density, 200/cs	\$37.13	\$222.78	\$31.95	\$191.72

MOLOKA'I

<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Maui Chemical & Paper</u>		<u>Triple F</u>	
		<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
25 case	3-compartment tray hinge w/lid, polypropylene, 8x8x3", white must be White Premier Essential MFPP, 200/cs NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$65.28	\$1,632.00	\$61.09	\$1,527.18
2 case	Tray 5-compartment, luau style, 10.5x8.5", compostable bagasse with wax lining, 4/125/case	\$66.56	\$133.04	\$103.12	\$206.23
4 case	7 oz Ribbed Plastic Cup, Y7, 25/100/cs	\$77.75	\$311.00	\$81.68	\$326.72
4 case	8 oz Karat Paper Hot Cup, White, 50/pk, 20pk/cs	\$56.19	\$224.76	\$59.50	\$238.00
12 case	Plastic Forks #3640, med/heavy weight, white, 6.5", 10/100/cs	\$14.47	\$173.64	\$24.01	\$288.13
12 case	Plastic Spoons #3642, med/heavy weight, white, 6.5", 10/100/cs	\$14.33	\$171.96	\$12.06	\$144.77
1 case	Plastic Knife, med/heavy weight, 100/pk, 10 pk/cs	\$13.12	\$13.12	\$18.15	\$18.15

<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Maui Chemical & Paper</u>		<u>Triple F</u>	
		<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1 case	Chopsticks, individual-wrapped, 3/4 wrap paper, 100 pairs/pk 40 pk/cs	\$120.52	\$120.52	\$67.80	\$67.80
1 case	Tea Bags, black tea, 312/cs	\$16.64	\$16.64	\$26.83	\$26.83
1 case	Creamer - Individual Serving Packet	\$18.90	\$18.90	\$19.49	\$19.49
1 case	Sugar, individual packets, 2000/case	\$18.36	\$18.36	\$16.25	\$16.25
12 case	Dispenser Napkin, tall fold white, 13.5x7", 20/500/case, Karat	\$62.55	\$750.60	\$59.59	\$715.10
6 case	Multi-Fold Paper Towel, White, 9.1 x 9.5", 4000/cs prefer Cascade Pro Select H124	\$35.15	\$210.90	\$24.56	\$147.34
6 case	Paper Towel Rolls, 2-ply, 30 rolls/case	\$45.54	\$273.24	\$35.97	\$215.83
6 case	Toilet Tissue Rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheets/roll, 96 rolls/case, 45lb	\$58.50	\$351.00	\$54.72	\$328.30
1 case	Facial Tissue, 2-ply, flat box, white, 48/125/case, prefer Kleenex	\$28.36	\$28.36	\$26.66	\$26.66
1 case	Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface, 6/95 pop-up container	\$54.03	\$54.03	\$52.35	\$52.35
5 case	Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 wipes each canister, 12 canisters per case, No Substitutions	\$44.05	\$220.25	\$105.00	\$525.00
1 case	Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheet, 12"x10.75", 500 shts/box 6 boxes/case, prefer Reynolds	\$117.96	\$117.96	\$11.80	\$11.80
6 case	Disposable Gloves, OEG-1, large size, poly hybrid, 5/200/case, prefer pop-up, no rolls	\$31.20	\$187.20	\$23.74	\$142.43
4 case	Food Tray, 1/2#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie	\$28.48	\$113.92	\$26.82	\$107.28
1 case	Food Tray, 1#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie	\$36.10	\$36.10	\$39.59	\$39.59
1 case	5 oz Food Container, polystyrene, clear, 10/100/case, #FK-5CC, must be Fabri-Kal FK-5CC, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$221.62	\$221.62	\$143.51	\$143.51
1 case	Lids for 5oz. Plastic Container, clear, flat, 8/125/case, #L5CC, must be Fabri-Kal L5CC, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$202.98	\$202.98	\$124.22	\$124.22
2 case	Dish Soap, 20 oz/bottle, 6 bottles/case, Dawn/Joy/Palmolive	\$42.51	\$85.02	\$30.08	\$60.16

<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Maui Chemical & Paper</u>		<u>Triple F</u>	
		<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1 case	Clorox Bleach, 16oz (or 5 case 32 oz.) bottles	No Bid	No Bid	\$208.43	\$208.43
1 case	Plastic Sandwich Bag, Zip Lock top	\$32.42	\$32.42	\$21.97	\$21.97
1 case	Press & Seal Wrap, dispenser type box	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.97	\$21.97
6 case	Trash Liner, 33x40, high density, black liner, 19 micron, 250/cs	\$31.76	\$190.56	\$32.50	\$195.00
6 case	Trash Liner, 55 gallon black, high-density, 200/cs	\$37.13	\$222.78	\$31.82	\$190.94

end list Tentative Low Bidder - **IN BOLD**