

BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M., August 24, 2021

JOB TITLE:

COVID-19 Antigen Tests (Self-Test)

JOB NO.

IFB No. 21-22/P-34

Vendor	County of Maui Preferred Abbott Binax Test		Alternative Tests Offered	
	Abbott Binax Now Test (Cost Per Test)	Net Total Outright Purchase Price (est. 50k tests)	Cost Per Test	Net Total Outright Purchase Price (est. 50k tests)
1 Health	\$10.50	\$525,000.00	\$10.00(Quidel Quickview OTC)	\$500,000.00
Beastmode Axiom LLC	\$31.25	\$1,562,500.00	\$24.75(Care Start Rapid Test)	\$1,237,500.00
Thermo Fisher Scientific	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.81(Quidel QKVUE COV AG)	\$490,621.86
Lab24	\$7.07	\$353,500.00	No Bid	No Bid
Impact Power Technologies	No Bid	No Bid	\$28.50(Intelliswab Kit)	\$1,425,000.00
IX Layer Inc	\$8.99	\$449,500.00	No Bid	No Bid
JDD Global Supply	\$18.00	\$900,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
New World Holdings Corp	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.75(CareStart)	\$637,500.00
Orasure Technologies Inc	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.80(Intelliswab Kit)	\$440,000.00
ProcureNet America	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.15(Lungene)	\$107,500.00
QYK Brands LLC	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.79(CareStart Rapid POC)	\$589,500.00
RP Medical LLC	\$11.65	\$582,500.00	\$14.10(Quidel QuickVue)	\$705,000.00
Safe Health Systems Inc	\$9.88	\$494,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
Lighthouse For The Blind	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.90(InBios SCOVID2 Rapid)	\$545,000.00

Tentative low bidder - **In Bold**

Bid Summaries emailed to:
 Managing Director
 Director of Finance
 Corporation Counsel
 Council Chairman
 Risk Management
 Budget Director

Bid Documents To:
 Josiah Nishita
 Deputy Managing Director

Opened by: Kevin Jiles, Purchasing Specialist

Witnessed by: Jared Masuda, Central Purchasing Agent