BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION
BID OPENING DATE:
2:00 P.M., January 20, 2022
JOB TITLE:
Furnishing & Delivery of Expendable Foodservice Products for Senior Services
JOB NO.
IFB 21-22/P-79
KAUNOA (MAUI)
Maui Chemical & Paper

Quantity Description Unit Price Amount
25 case ECO-HD-8HW3 8” Heavy Duty 3-Compartment $96.34 | $2,408.50

Compostable Hinge Tray 2/100’s
Bridgegate 7-7/8 x 7-3/4 x 2-7/10
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

20 case 9" 3-Compartment White Plate, Round, Bagasse Compostable, $80.74 | $1,614.80

4/125/case, WHBRG-9-3

12 case Tray 5-compartment, luau style, 10.5x8.5", compostable No Bid No Bid

bagasse with wax lining, 4/125/case

6 case 8 oz Ripple Hot Paper Cup, C-KRC508, 25/100/cs, Kraft No Bid | No Bid

36 case 21807 Compostable Forks, White $49.77 | $1,791.72

Transitions2Earth 5/200BX 1M/CS

36 case 21807 Compostable Spoons, Green $57.51 | $2,070.36

Transitions2Earth 200EA/BX 5BX/CS

6 case 21808 Compostable Knife, White $57.51 | $345.06

Transitions2Earth 5/200BX 1M/CS

2 case Chopsticks, individual-wrapped, 3/4 wrap paper, 100 pairs/pk, $129.22 | $258.44
40 pk/cs

4 case TeaBags, black tea, 312/cs $16.64 | $66.56

4 case Creamer - Individual Serving Packet, per case $20.17 | $80.68

4 case  Sugar, individual packets, 2000/case $18.88 | $75.52
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Wood Coffee Stirrers 7.5", Round End, 10/500/cs

Dispenser Napkin, tall fold white, 13.5x7", 20/500/case, Karat

Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface, 6/95 pop-up
container

Description

Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 wipes each canister, 12 canisters
per case, No Substitutions

Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheet, 12"x10.75", 500 shts/box
6 boxes/case, prefer Reynolds

KAR-FWAFS100

Disposable Gloves, OEG-1, large size, poly hybrid,
5/205/200/case, prefer pop-up, no rolls

Food Tray, 1/2#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie

Food Tray, 1#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie

C-KDP4W KARAT 4 oz Double Poly Paper Food Container
20/50 1000/CS, White

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

C-KDL76-PP Flat Lid for C-KDP4W Double Poly

Paper Food Container 20/50 1000/CS, White

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Dish Soap, 20 oz/bottle, 6 bottles/case, Dawn/Joy/Palmolive
Clorox Bleach, 160z (or 5 case 32 oz.) bottles

Maui Chem Item #4750523 6/1GAL

Plastic Sandwich Bag, Zip Lock top

Press & Seal Wrap, dispenser type box

IFB - Expendable Foodservice Products for Senior Services

$3841 | $38.41
$66.50 | $1,662.50
$5403 | $270.15

Maui Chemical & Paper

Unit Price Amount
$3500 | $700.00
$161.47 | $807.35
$3207 | $384.84
NoBid | NoBid
NoBid | NoBid
NoBid |  NoBid
No Bid No Bid
$4276 | $85.52
$3343 | 53343
$36.14 | $36.14
NoBid | NoBid




1 case 5.50z White Baking Cup, 500/bx, 20 bx/cs
6 case Trash Liner, 33x40, high density, black liner, 19 micron,
250/cs

6 case Trash Liner, 55 gallon black, high-density, 200/cs
Maui Chem Item #5751066 37x55 1.6Mil 100/CS

32 case 3-Compartment Compostable Trays
13.50z/ 60z/ 60z Oliver Packaging #51451TPLA 800 Trays/Case
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

30 case 5 0z. Compostable Round Deli Container, Clear

30 case Lids 5 oz. Compostable Round Deli Container, Clear, Flat

100 each  Microcore Flex Pack 5” x 7” x 1” Oliver Packaging #61997

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

30 case Earthchoice 4 oz Portion Cups. 2400/CS

30 case Earthchoice Lids for 4 oz Portion Cups. 2400/CS

LANA'I
Quantity Description

50 case ECO-HD-8HW3 8” Heavy Duty 3-Compartment
Compostable Hinge Tray 2/100’s
Bridgegate 7-7/8 x 7-3/4 x 2-7/10
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

2 case Tray 5-compartment, luau style, 10.5x8.5", compostable
bagasse with wax lining, 4/125/case

Quantity Description

6 case 8 oz Karat Paper Hot Cup, White, 50/pk, 20pk/cs

12 case 21807 Compostable Forks, White
Transitions2Earth 5/200BX 1M/CS

IFB - Expendable Foodservice Products for Senior Services

$80.36 |  $80.36

$39.15 | $234.90
$33.71 | $202.26
NoBid | NoBid
NoBid | NoBid
NoBid | NoBid
NoBid | NoBid
$180.93 | $5,427.90
$130.30 | $3,909.00

Maui Chemical & Paper

Unit Price Amount
$96.34 | $4,817.00
No Bid No Bid

Maui Chemical & Paper

Unit Price Amount
NoBid |  NoBid
$49.77 | $597.24




12 case
1 case
1 case
1 case
1 case
1 case
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6 case
6 case
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21807 Compostable Spoons, Green
Transitions2Earth 200EA/BX 5BX/CS

21808 Compostable Knife, White
Transitions2Earth 5/200BX 1M/CS

Chopsticks, individual-wrapped, 3/4 wrap paper 100 pairs/pk

Tea Bags, black tea, 312/cs

Creamer - Individual Serving Packet, per case

Sugar, individual packets, 2000/case

Decaffinated Instant Ground Coffee
30.5 oz canisters, 4/case, prefer Folgers or similar

Dispenser Napkin, tall fold white, 13.5x7", 20/500/case, Karat

Multi-Fold Paper Towel, White, 9.1 x 9.5", 4000/cs
prefer Cascade Pro Select H124

Paper Towel Rolls, 2-ply, 30 rolls/case

Toilet Tissue Rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheets/roll, 96 rolls/case, 45lb

Facial Tissue, 2-ply box, white 48/125/case, prefer Klennex

Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface, 6/95 pop-up
container

Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 wipes each canister, 12 canisters
per case. No Substitutions

Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheet, 12"x10.75", 500 shts/box
6 boxes/case, prefer Reynolds

IFB - Expendable Foodservice Products for Senior Services

$57.51 |  $690.12
$57.51 |  $57.51
$129.22 | $129.22
$16.64 | $16.64
$2017 | $20.17
$1888 | $18.88
NoBid | NoBid
$66.50 | $798.00
$35.15 | $210.90
$4554 | $273.24
$5850 | $351.00
$96.16 |  $96.16
$5403 |  $54.03
$3500 | $175.00
$161.47 | $161.47
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Disposable Gloves, OEG-1, med size, poly hybrid, 5/200/case,
prefer pop-up, no rolls

Description

Food Tray, 1/2#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie

Food Tray, 1#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie

C-KDP4W KARAT 4 oz Double Poly Paper
Food Container 20/50 1000/CS, White
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

C-KDL76-PP Flat Lid for C-KDP4W Double Poly

Paper Food Container 20/50 1000/CS, White

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Dish Soap, 20 oz/bottle, 6 bottles/case, Dawn/Palmolive
Clorox Bleach, 160z (or 5 case 32 oz.) bottles

Maui Chem Item #4750523 6/1Gal

Plastic Sandwich Bag, Zip Lock top

Press & Seal Wrap, dispenser type box

Trash Liner, 33x40, high density, black liner, 19 micron,
250/cs

Trash Liner, 55 gallon black, high-density, 200/cs
Maui Chem Item #5751066 37x55 1.6MIL 100/CS

Description

ECO-HD-8HW3 8” Heavy Duty 3-Compartment
Compostable Hinge Tray 2/100’s

Bridgegate 7-7/8 x 7-3/4 x 2-7/10

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Tray 5-compartment, luau style, 10.5x8.5", compostable
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$32.27 |

$193.62

Maui Chemical & Paper

Unit Price Amount
NoBid | NoBid
NoBid |  NoBid
NoBid | NoBid
No Bid No Bid
$4276 |  $85.52
$3343 | 53343
$36.12 | $36.12
NoBid | NoBid
$39.15 | $234.26

$33.71 | $202.26

Maui Chemical & Paper

Unit Price Amount
$96.34 | $2,408.50
No Bid No Bid
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1 case
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bagasse with wax lining, 4/125/case

8 oz Karat Paper Hot Cup, White, 50/pk, 20pk/cs

21807 Compostable Forks, White

Transitions2Earth 5/200BX 1M/CS

21807 Compostable Spoons, Green
Transitions2Earth 200EA/BX 5BX/CS

21808 Compostable Knife, White
Transitions2Earth 5/200BX 1M/CS

Description

Chopsticks, individual-wrapped, 3/4 wrap paper, 100 pairs/pk
40 pk/cs

Tea Bags, black tea, 312/cs

Creamer - Individual Serving Packet

Sugar, individual packets, 2000/case

Dispenser Napkin, tall fold white, 13.5x7", 20/500/case, Karat

Multi-Fold Paper Towel, White, 9.1 x 9.5", 4000/cs
prefer Cascade Pro Select H124

Paper Towel Rolls, 2-ply, 30 rolls/case

Toilet Tissue Rolls, 2-ply, 500 sheets/roll, 96 rolls/case, 45lb

Facial Tissue, 2-ply, flat box, white 48/125/case, prefer
Kleenex

Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface, 6/95 pop-up

container

Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 wipes each canister, 12 canisters
per case, No Substitutions
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NoBid | NoBid
$49.77 | $597.24
$57.51 | $690.12
$57.51 |  $57.51

Maui Chemical & Paper

Unit Price Amount
$129.22 | $129.22
$16.64 | $16.64
$2017 | $20.17
$1888 | $18.88
$66.50 | $798.00
$35.15 | $210.90
$45.54 | $273.24
$58.50 | $351.00
$96.16 |  $96.16
$5403 | $54.03
$35.00 | $175.00
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Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheet, 12"x10.75", 500 shts/box
6 boxes/case, prefer Reynolds

Disposable Gloves, OEG-1, large size, poly hybrid, 5/200/case,

prefer pop-up, no rolls

Food Tray, 1/2#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie

Food Tray, 1#, Red Plaid, 4/250/case, Dixie

C-KDP4W KARAT 4 oz Double Poly Paper
Food Container 20/50 1000/CS, White

NO SUBSTITUTIONS

C-KDL76-PP Flat Lid for C-KDP4W Double Poly
Paper Food Container 20/50 1000/CS, White
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Dish Soap, 20 oz/bottle, 6 bottles/case, Dawn/Palmolive

Description

Clorox Bleach, 160z (or 5 case 32 oz.) bottles
Maui Chem Item #4750523 6/1GAL

Plastic Sandwich Bag, Zip Lock top

Press & Seal Wrap, dispenser type box

Trash Liner, 33x40, high density, black liner, 19 micron,

250/cs

Trash Liner, 55 gallon black, high-density, 200/cs

$161.47 | $161.47
$3207 | $192.42
NoBid | NoBid
NoBid | NoBid
NoBid | NoBid
No Bid No Bid
$4276 | $85.52

Maui Chemical & Paper

Unit Price Amount
$33.43 | $33.43
$36.14 | $36.14
NoBid | NoBid
$39.15 | $234.90
$33.71 | $202.26
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