

BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M., February 15, 2022

JOB TITLE:

Furnishing of Labor & Equipment for Trimming & Removing of Trees Within Various County of Maui Parks

JOB NO.

IFB No. 21-22/P-93

VENDOR	Section A South District	Section B East District	Section C Hana District	Section D West District	Section E Lanai District	Section F Molokai District	Section G Central District
Maui Arbor Scape	No Bid	\$148,760.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pua Ohana Tree Trimming & Landscaping	\$35,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$22,000.00	\$48,700.00	\$18,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$55,000.00
Wailea Trees & Landscape Professionals	\$25,000.00	\$34,000.00	\$9,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$30,000.00	\$60,000.00

Tentative low bidder - **In Bold**

Bid Summaries emailed to:

Managing Director

Director of Finance

Corporation Counsel

Council Chairman

Risk Management

Budget Director

Bid Documents To:

Chris Kinzle

Maintenance Division, Department of Parks & Recreation

Opened by: Kevin Jiles, Purchasing Specialist

Witnessed by: Jared Masuda, Central Purchasing Agent