

BID RESULTS

COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE

PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M., March 24, 2022

JOB TITLE:

Bus Transportation for the Summer and Winter Pals Program (RE-BID)

JOB NO.

IFB 21-22/P-101A

	Ground Transportation, Inc.	Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Inc.
ZONE A - WEST MAUI		
1. Intra Zone (2 times/wk; 3 stops max)	\$263.00	\$259.00
2. Zone A to Zone B (3 stops max.)	\$298.00	\$259.00
3. Zone A to Zone C (3 stops max.)	\$298.00	\$269.00
4. Zone A to Zone D (3 stops max.)	\$335.00	\$359.00
5. Zone Z to Zone E (3 stops max.)	\$325.00	\$309.00
6. Zone A to Zone F (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$899.00
ZONE B - SOUTH MAUI		
1. Intra Zone (2 times/wk; 3 stops max)	\$245.00	\$199.00
2. Zone B to Zone A (3 stops max.)	\$297.00	\$259.00
3. Zone B to Zone C (3 stops max.)	\$245.00	\$199.00
4. Zone B to Zone D (3 stops max.)	\$255.00	\$299.00
5. Zone B to Zone E (3 stops max.)	\$263.00	\$269.00
6. Zone B to Zone F (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$799.00
ZONE C - CENTRAL MAUI		
1. Intra Zone (2 times/week; 3 stops max.)	\$245.00	\$179.00
2. Zone C to Zone A (3 stops max.)	\$297.00	\$249.00
3. Zone C to Zone B (3 stops max.)	\$245.00	\$199.00
4. Zone C to Zone D (3 stops max.)	\$255.00	\$259.00
5. Zone C to Zone E (3 stops max.)	\$245.00	\$199.00
6. Zone C to Zone F (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$699.00
ZONE D - UPCOUNTRY MAUI		
1. Intra Zone (2 times/week; 3 stops max.)	\$253.00	\$209.00
2. Zone D to Zone A (3 stops max.)	\$368.00	\$349.00
3. Zone D to Zone B (3 stops max.)	\$262.00	\$259.00
4. Zone D to Zone C (3 stops max.)	\$255.00	\$239.00
5. Zone D to Zone E (3 stops max.)	\$250.00	\$229.00
6. Zone D to Zone F (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$699.00

	Ground Transportation, Inc.	Robert's Hawaii School Bus, Inc.
1. Intra-Zone (2 times/wk; 3 stops max.)	\$245.00	\$189.00
2. Zone E1 to Zone A (3 stops max.)	\$330.00	\$289.00
3. Zone E1 to Zone B (3 stops max.)	\$263.00	\$239.00
4. Zone E1 to Zone C (3 stops max.)	\$245.00	\$199.00
5. Zone E1 to Zone D (3 stops max.)	\$255.00	\$209.00
6. Zone E1 to Zone F (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$849.00
7. Intra Zone (2 times/wk; 3 stops max)	\$245.00	\$179.00
8. Zone E2 to Zone A (3 stops max.)	\$342.00	\$299.00
9. Zone E2 to Zone B (3 stops max.)	\$265.00	\$245.00
10. Zone E2 to Zone C (3 stops max.)	\$255.00	\$205.00
11. Zone E2 to Zone D (3 stops max.)	\$267.00	\$205.00
12. Zone E2 to Zone F (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$849.00
ZONE F - HANA		
1. Zone F to Zone A (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$999.00
2. Zone F to Zone B (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$999.00
3. Zone F to Zone C (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$899.00
4. Zone F to Zone D (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$849.00
5. Zone F to Zone E (3 stops max.)	No Bid	\$849.00

Tentative low bidder - **In Bold**

Bid Summaries emailed to:

Managing Director

Director of Finance

Corporation Counsel

Director of Parks & Recreation

Council Chairman

Budget Director

Risk Management

Bid Documents To:

Ryan Min

Opened by:

Billie Nakagawa, Purchasing Specialist

Witnessed by:

Kevin Jiles, Purchasing Specialist