

# BID RESULTS

## COUNTY OF MAUI DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE - PURCHASING DIVISION

BID OPENING DATE:

2:00 P.M., July 28, 2022

JOB TITLE:

Furnishing & Delivery of Expendable Foodservice Products for Senior Services

JOB NO.

IFB 22-23/P-43

KAUNOA (MAUI)

Quantity	Description	Maui Chemical & Paper		ODP Business Solutions LLC	
		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
60 case	ECO-HD-8HW3, 8" Heavy Duty 3-Compartment Compostable Hinge Tray, 2/100, Bridgegate 7-7/8 x 7-3/4 x 2-7/10 NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$64.31	\$3,858.60	\$106.99	\$6,419.40
		#2253582		8537177	
20 case	WHBRG-9-3, 9" 3-Compartment White Bagasse Plate, Round, Compostable, Bridgegate, 4/125/cs	\$89.39	\$1,787.80	\$89.60	\$1,792.00
		#2254014		255126.00	
10 case	WHBRG-09, 9" White Bagasse Paper Plate, Round, Compostable, Bridgegate, 4/125/cs	\$78.10	\$781.00	\$62.41	\$624.10
		#2254005		224760.00	
10 case	Tray 5-compartment, molded fiber, 8.5 x 10.5 x 5/8", compostable, Chinet/Huhtamaki 22025 preferred, 4/125/cs	\$103.89	\$1,038.90	\$151.25	\$1,512.50
		#2656007		9777644.00	
12 case	8 oz Ripple Hot Paper Cup, C-KRC508, 25/100/cs, Kraft	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
2 case	8 oz Eco-Friendly Insulated Hot Paper Cup, KE-KIC508 Karat Earth, One Earth Compostable, 25/pk 500/cs	\$90.58	\$181.16	No Bid	No Bid
		#1354560			
2 case	12 oz Eco-Friendly Cold Paper Cup, KE-KCP12 Karat Earth, One Earth Compostable, 50/pk 1000/cs	\$105.06	\$210.12	No Bid	No Bid
		#12540800			
60 case	Compostable Forks, 21807, Prefer White, Transitions2Earth, 200ea/bx, 5 bx/cs	\$57.51	\$3,450.60	\$48.13	\$2,887.80
		#1354029		6129063	
60 case	Compostable Spoons, 21817, Prefer White, Transitions2Earth, 200ea/bx, 5 bx/cs	\$57.51	\$3,450.60	\$49.54	\$2,972.40
		#1354032		7474183	
6 case	Compostable Knives, 21808, Prefer White, Transitions2Earth, 5/200BX, 1M/CS	\$57.51	\$345.06	\$49.54	\$297.24
		#1354031		9496973	
2 case	Chopsticks, individual-wrapped, 3/4 wrap paper, 100 pairs/pk, 40 pk/cs	\$172.58	\$345.16	\$102.52	\$205.04
		#1350510		1798750	
6 case	Tea Bags, black tea, 312/cs	\$16.64	\$99.84	No Bid	No Bid
		#8123188			
6 case	Creamer - Individual Serving Packets, 1000/2G/CS	\$18.90	\$113.40	No Bid	No Bid
		#1202505			
6 case	Sugar - Individual Serving Packets, 2000/case	\$18.36	\$110.16	\$13.95	\$83.70
		#1203505		5245328	

Quantity	Description	Maui Chemical & Paper		Office Depot	
		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
1 case	Wood Coffee Stirrers 7.5", Round End, 10/500/cs	N/A	N/A	\$41.05	\$41.05
				1798912	
60 case	Dispenser Napkin, tall fold white, 13.5x7", 20/500/case, Karat	\$71.54	\$4,292.40	\$45.05	\$2,703.00
		#2054026		1752265	
6 case	Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface, 6/95 pop-up container	\$62.70	\$376.20	\$58.58	\$351.48
		#2553038		8452086	
20 case	Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 wipes each canister, 12 canisters per case NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$44.05	\$881.00	\$41.05	\$821.00
		#8143814		733753	
6 case	Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheet, 12"x10.75", 500 shts/box 6 boxes/case, prefer Reynolds KAR-FWAFS100	\$202.29	\$1,213.74	\$136.07	\$816.42
		#0103539		290453	
12 case	Disposable Gloves, OEG-1, large size, poly hybrid, 5/205/200/case, prefer pop-up, no rolls	\$32.07	\$384.84	\$31.59	\$379.08
		#4650538		727023	
10 case	RP50 Dixie 1/2# Food Tray, Red Plaid, 4/250/cs	\$35.62	\$356.20	\$39.00	\$390.00
		#2652561		1794574	
10 case	RP1008 Dixie 1# Food Tray, Red Plaid, 4/250/cs	\$46.35	\$463.50	\$34.13	\$341.30
		#2652562		8232923	
60 case	4oz Portion Cup, EP-PC400, PLA-Compostable, 100/pk, 2000/cs NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$210.76	\$12,645.60	\$175.50	\$10,530.00
		#1256556		5585012	
60 case	Lids for 4oz Portion Cup, EP-PCLID, Compostable, 100/pk, 2000/cs NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$147.56	\$8,853.60	\$132.63	\$7,957.80
		1955540		4356996	
2 case	Dish Soap, 20 oz/bottle, 6 bottles/case, Dawn/Joy/Palmolive	\$42.51	\$85.02	\$55.66	\$111.32
		4450521		217739	
1 case	Clorox Germicidal Bleach 30966 Liquid Concentrate, 3/121 FL OZ	\$27.99	\$27.99	\$29.58	\$29.58
		4750518		217595	
1 case	F20606 2mil Ziplock Bags 6x6, 10/100/cs	\$36.19	\$36.19	\$29.96	\$29.96
		#0258038		1798849	
1 case	4200434 Baking Cup Liner D/W, 4.75x2x1-3/8", Patterson, 20/500cs	\$103.42	\$103.42	\$83.04	\$83.04
		#0350530		1795402	
6 case	Trash Liner, CP334019K, 33x40, high density black liner, 19 micron, 250/cs	\$35.06	\$210.36	\$38.67	\$232.02
		5750566		5431226	
6 case	Trash Liner, MC55, 37x55, 1.6 mil heavy duty trash liner, 100/cs 72 cs/pallet	\$38.30	\$229.80	\$46.13	\$276.78
		5751066		7023749	

**LANA'I**

Quantity	Description	Maui Chemical & Paper		Office Depot	
		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
2 case	ECO-HD-8HW3, 8" Heavy Duty 3-Compartment Compostable Hinge Tray, 2/100, Bridgegate 7-7/8 x 7-3/4 x 2-7/10	\$64.31	\$128.62	\$106.99	\$213.98
		2653582		8537177	
24 case	J0560096 3-Compartment Hinged Tray 8x8x3 White Premier, Essential MFPP, 200/cs, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$86.29	\$2,070.96	\$70.52	\$1,692.48
		2653592			
5 case	Tray 5-compartment, molded fiber, 8.5 x 10.5 x 5/8", compostable, Chinet/Huhtamaki 22025 preferred, 4/125/cs	\$103.89	\$519.45	\$151.25	\$756.25
		2656007		9777644	
2 case	8 oz Ripple Hot Paper Cup, C-KRC508, 25/100/cs, Kraft	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
2 case	8 oz Eco-Friendly Insulated Hot Paper Cup, KE-KIC508 Karat Earth, One Earth Compostable, 25/pk 500/cs	\$90.58	\$181.16	No Bid	No Bid
		1354560			
2 case	12 oz Eco-Friendly Cold Paper Cup, KE-KCP12 Karat Earth, One Earth Compostable, 50/pk 1000/cs	\$105.06	\$210.12	No Bid	No Bid
		12540800			
10 case	Compostable Forks, 21807, Prefer White, Transitions2Earth, 200ea/bx, 5 bx/cs	\$57.51	\$575.10	\$48.13	\$481.30
		1354029		6129063	
10 case	Compostable Spoons, 21817, Prefer White, Transitions2Earth, 200ea/bx, 5 bx/cs	\$57.51	\$575.10	\$49.54	\$495.40
		1354032		7474183	
4 case	Compostable Knives, 21808, Prefer White, Transitions2Earth, 5/200BX, 1M/CS	\$57.51	\$230.04	\$49.54	\$198.16
		1354031		9496973	
2 case	Chopsticks, individual-wrapped, 3/4 wrap paper, 100 pairs/pk, 40 pk/cs	\$172.58	\$345.16	\$102.52	\$205.04
		1350510		1798750	
1 case	Tea Bags, black tea, 312/cs	\$16.64	\$16.64	No Bid	No Bid
		8123188			
1 case	Creamer - Individual Serving Packets, 1000/2G/CS	\$18.90	\$18.90	No Bid	No Bid
		1202505			
1 case	Sugar - Individual Serving Packets, 2000/case	\$18.36	\$18.36	\$13.95	\$13.95
		1203505		5245328	
1 case	Wood Coffee Stirrers 7.5", Round End, 10/500/cs	N/A	N/A	\$41.05	\$41.05
				1798912	
20 case	Dispenser Napkin, tall fold white, 13.5x7", 20/500/case, Karat	\$71.54	\$1,430.80	\$45.05	\$901.00
		2054026		1752265	
2 case	Multi-Fold Paper Towel, White, 9.1 x 9.5", 4000/cs prefer Cascade Pro Select H124	\$38.15	\$76.30	\$35.01	\$70.02
		2552015		9802184	
2 case	GEN1797 Kitchen Roll Paper Towel, 2-ply, white, 85-sheets/roll, 30 roll/cs	\$42.07	\$84.14	\$43.93	\$87.86
		2551524		694185	

<u>Quantity</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Maui Chemical &amp; Paper</u>		<u>Office Depot</u>	
		<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Unit Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
2 case	13217 Toilet Tissue Rolls, Scott 100% Recycled Fiber, 4x4", 506 sheets/roll, 80 rolls/cs	\$69.58	\$139.16	<b>\$58.81</b>	<b>\$117.62</b>
		2453508		9480631	
1 case	Facial Tissue, 2-ply, flat box white, prefer Kleenex 21606, 48/125cs	\$96.16	\$96.16	<b>\$95.00</b>	<b>\$95.00</b>
		2451012		3744522	
2 case	Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface, 6/95 pop-up container	\$62.70	\$125.40	<b>\$58.58</b>	<b>\$117.16</b>
		2553038		8452086	
6 case	Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 wipes each canister, 12 canisters per case, No Substitutions	\$44.05	\$264.30	<b>\$41.05</b>	<b>\$246.30</b>
		8143814		733753	
1 case	Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheet, 12"x10.75", 500 shts/box 6 boxes/case, prefer Reynolds KAR-FWAFS100	\$202.29	\$202.29	<b>\$136.07</b>	<b>\$136.07</b>
		#0103539		290453	
2 case	Disposable Gloves, OEG-1, large size, poly hybrid, 5/205/200/case, prefer pop-up, no rolls	\$32.07	\$64.14	<b>\$31.59</b>	<b>\$63.18</b>
		4650538		7272023	
4 case	RP50 Dixie 1/2# Food Tray, Red Plaid, 4/250/cs	<b>\$35.62</b>	<b>\$142.48</b>	\$39.00	\$156.00
		2652561		1794574	
4 case	RP1008 Dixie 1# Food Tray, Red Plaid, 4/250/cs	\$46.35	\$185.40	<b>\$34.13</b>	<b>\$136.52</b>
		2652562		8232923	
2 case	Dish Soap, 20 oz/bottle, 6 bottles/case, Dawn/Joy/Palmolive	<b>\$42.51</b>	<b>\$85.02</b>	\$55.66	\$111.32
		4450521		217739	
1 case	Clorox Germicidal Bleach 30966 Liquid Concentrate, 3/121 FL OZ	<b>\$27.99</b>	<b>\$27.99</b>	\$29.58	\$29.58
		4750518		217595	
1 case	F20606 2mil Ziplock Bags 6x6, 10/100/cs	\$36.19	\$36.19	<b>\$29.96</b>	<b>\$29.96</b>
		#0258038		1798849	
1 case	4200434 Baking Cup Liner D/W, 4.75x2x1-3/8", Patterson, 20/500cs	\$103.42	\$103.42	<b>\$83.04</b>	<b>\$154.68</b>
		#0350530		1795402	
4 case	Trash Liner, CP334019K, 33x40, high density black liner, 19 micron, 250/cs	<b>\$35.06</b>	<b>\$140.24</b>	\$38.67	\$154.68
		5750566		5431226	
4 case	Trash Liner, MC55, 37x55, 1.6 mil heavy duty trash liner, 100/cs 72 cs/pallet	<b>\$38.30</b>	<b>\$153.20</b>	\$46.13	\$184.52
		5751066		7023749	

**MOLOKA'I**

		Maui Chemical & Paper		Office Depot		
		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	
2	case	ECO-HD-8HW3, 8" Heavy Duty 3-Compartment Compostable Hinge Tray, 2/100, Bridgegate 7-7/8 x 7-3/4 x 2-7/10	\$64.31	\$128.62	\$106.99	\$213.98
		2653582		8537177		
24	case	J0560096 3-Compartment Hinged Tray 8x8x3 White Premier, Essential MFPP, 200/cs, NO SUBSTITUTIONS	\$86.29	\$2,070.96	\$70.52	\$1,692.48
		2653592				
5	case	Tray 5-compartment, molded fiber, 8.5 x 10.5 x 5/8", compostable, Chinet/Huhtamaki 22025 preferred, 4/125/cs	\$103.89	\$519.45	\$151.25	\$756.25
		2656007		9777644		
2	case	8 oz Ripple Hot Paper Cup, C-KRC508, 25/100/cs, Kraft	N/A	N/A	No Bid	No Bid
2	case	8 oz Eco-Friendly Insulated Hot Paper Cup, KE-KIC508 Karat Earth, One Earth Compostable, 25/pk 500/cs	\$90.58	\$181.16	No Bid	No Bid
		1354560				
2	case	12 oz Eco-Friendly Cold Paper Cup, KE-KCP12 Karat Earth, One Earth Compostable, 50/pk 1000/cs	\$105.06	\$210.12	No Bid	No Bid
		12540800				
10	case	Compostable Forks, 21807, Prefer White, Transitions2Earth, 200ea/bx, 5 bx/cs	\$57.51	\$575.10	\$48.13	\$481.30
		1354029		6129063		
10	case	Compostable Spoons, 21817, Prefer White, Transitions2Earth, 200ea/bx, 5 bx/cs	\$57.51	\$575.10	\$49.54	\$495.40
		1354032		7474183		
4	case	Compostable Knives, 21808, Prefer White, Transitions2Earth, 5/200BX, 1M/CS	\$57.51	\$230.04	\$49.54	\$198.16
		1354032		9496973		
2	case	Chopsticks, individual-wrapped, 3/4 wrap paper, 100 pairs/pk, 40 pk/cs	\$172.58	\$345.16	\$102.52	\$205.04
		1350510		1798750		
1	case	Tea Bags, black tea, 312/cs	\$16.64	\$16.64	No Bid	No Bid
		8123188				
1	case	Creamer - Individual Serving Packets, 1000/2G/CS	\$18.90	\$18.90	No Bid	No Bid
		1202505				
1	case	Sugar - Individual Serving Packets, 2000/case	\$18.36	\$18.36	\$13.95	\$13.95
		1203505		5245328		
1	case	Wood Coffee Stirrers 7.5", Round End, 10/500/cs	N/A	N/A	\$41.05	\$41.05
				1798912		
20	case	Dispenser Napkin, tall fold white, 13.5x7", 20/500/case, Karat	\$71.54	\$143.08	\$45.05	\$901.00
		2054026		1752265		
2	case	Multi-Fold Paper Towel, White, 9.1 x 9.5", 4000/cs prefer Cascade Pro Select H124	\$38.15	\$76.30	\$35.01	\$70.02
		2552015		9802184		
2	case	GEN1797 Kitchen Roll Paper Towel, 2-ply, white, 85-sheets/roll, 30 roll/cs	\$42.07	\$84.14	\$43.93	\$87.86
		2551524		694185		

Quantity	Description	Maui Chemical & Paper		Office Depot	
		Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
2 case	13217 Toilet Tissue Rolls, Scott 100% Recycled Fiber, 4x4", 506 sheets/roll, 80 rolls/cs	\$69.58	\$139.16	\$58.81	\$117.62
		2453508		9480631	
1 case	Facial Tissue, 2-ply, flat box white, prefer Kleenex 21606, 48/125cs	\$96.16	\$96.16	\$95.00	\$95.00
		2451012		3744522	
2 case	Sanitizing Wipes, No-Rinse, Multi-Surface, 6/95 pop-up container	\$62.70	\$125.40	\$58.58	\$117.16
		2553038		8452086	
6 case	Clorox Disinfecting Wipes, 35 wipes each canister, 12 canisters per case, No Substitutions	\$44.05	\$264.30	\$41.05	\$246.30
		8143814		733753	
1 case	Aluminum Foil, pop-up sheet, 12"x10.75", 500 shts/box 6 boxes/case, prefer Reynolds KAR-FWAFS100	\$202.29	\$202.29	\$136.07	\$136.07
		#0103539		290453	
2 case	Disposable Gloves, OEG-1, large size, poly hybrid, 5/205/200/case, prefer pop-up, no rolls	\$32.07	\$64.14	\$31.59	\$63.18
		4650538		7272023	
4 case	RP50 Dixie 1/2# Food Tray, Red Plaid, 4/250/cs	\$35.62	\$142.48	\$39.00	\$156.00
		2652561		1794574	
4 case	RP1008 Dixie 1# Food Tray, Red Plaid, 4/250/cs	\$46.35	\$185.40	\$34.13	\$136.52
		2652562		8232923	
2 case	Dish Soap, 20 oz/bottle, 6 bottles/case, Dawn/Joy/Palmolive	\$42.51	\$85.02	\$55.66	\$111.32
		4450521		217739	
1 case	Clorox Germicidal Bleach 30966 Liquid Concentrate, 3/121 FL OZ	\$27.99	\$27.99	\$29.58	\$29.58
		4750518		217595	
1 case	F20606 2mil Ziplock Bags 6x6, 10/100/cs	\$36.19	\$36.19	\$29.96	\$29.96
		#0258038		1798849	
1 case	4200434 Baking Cup Liner D/W, 4.75x2x1-3/8", Patterson, 20/500cs	\$103.42	\$103.42	\$83.04	\$83.04
		#0350530		1795402	
4 case	Trash Liner, CP334019K, 33x40, high density black liner, 19 micron, 250/cs	\$35.06	\$140.24	\$38.67	\$154.68
		5750566		5431226	
4 case	Trash Liner, MC55, 37x55, 1.6 mil heavy duty trash liner, 100/cs 72 cs/pallet	\$38.30	\$153.20	\$46.13	\$184.52
		5751066		7023749	